Reflective Sign Materials
HWAY 13-12 Tally Sheet — March 29, 2013

Custom Garden State
Vendors: Vulcan 3M Rocal Products . Osburn Assoc
Corp Highway
Section 1 Price/Sq Ft Price/Sq Ft Price/Sq Ft Price/Sq Ft Price/Sq Ft Price/Sq Ft
Pressure-Sensitive for 3290 3M Avery
use in Electronic .75 | 3200 . 3200 3200
L Plotters CW 80 Orange 65 NoBid 85 76 | 3200 T-1500
Product Codes 1.05 14 .69
Pressure-Sensitive for
1A use in Electronic 3430 3430 No Bid 3400 3400 3430 T-2500
Plotters .69 .65 .78 .69 .65 .65
Product Codes
1B Pressu_re-Sensitive 3650 No Bid 3650 3650-12 HP700-190-0
Adhesive Product Codes .99 .70 1.03 .96 .88 31
) iﬁﬁg‘;{\fensm"e 3930 3930 No Bid 3930 3930 3930 T-6500
1.36 1.18 1.49 1.31 1.31 1.15
Product Codes
3 Barricade Product 3334/3336 No Bid 333 334/336 334/336 W6100/W6200
Codes 1.55 1.18 1.69 1.59 1.57 1.46
. ;ﬁﬁg‘;{jfens'“"e 4090 \o Bid 4000 4000 4090 T-11500
3.82 3.48 3.95 3.96 3.93 3.33
Product Codes
5 irjﬁzgir\%sens'“"e 4080 No Bid 4080 4081/83/84 | 4080 T-11500
3.97 3.48 3.95 4.07 4.03 3.33
Product Codes
5 Transfer Tape TPM-5 No Bid TPM-5 TPM-5 Z1000/Z1100
Product Codes 41 32 43 .38 .33 15
7 Electro Cut Film 1170 No Bid 1170 1170 OL-2000
Product Codes 1.09 .98 1.17 1.06 1.05 .90
Minimum Order 1,200.00
Section 11
Type 1 Pressure-
1 Sensitive
One Color
0-1 Square feet .90 No Bid 4.50 2.54 94 1.06 1.06

4/10/2013 dt




1-4 Square feet .90 No Bid 141 1.20 .92 1.06 1.06
4+ Square feet .90 No Bid 1.18 1.18 90 1.06 1.06
Type 1 Pressure-
Sensitive Two Color
0-1 Square feet 1.02 No Bid 6.99 2.87 .98 1.31 1.31
2 | 1-4 Square feet 1.02 No Bid 1.64 1.48 .96 1.31 1.31
4+ Square feet 1.02 No Bid 1.41 1.43 94 1.31 1.31
Type 1 Pressure-
Sensitive Three Color
0-1 Square feet 1.15 No Bid 8.50 3.16 1.19 1.56 1.56
1-4 Square feet 1.15 No Bid 2.24 1.62 1.17 1.56 1.56
3 4+ Square feet 1.15 No Bid 2.01 2.03 1.15 1.56 1.56
HIP One Color
4 0-1 Square feet 1.67 No Bid 5.50 3.05 1.77 1.70 1.54
1-4 Square feet 1.67 No Bid 2.04 1.94 1.72 1.70 1.54
4+ Square feet 1.67 No Bid 1.81 1.80 1.66 1.70 1.54
HIP Two Color
5 0-1 Square feet 1.79 No Bid 8.99 3.31 1.82 1.95 1.79
1-4 Square feet 1.79 No Bid 2.24 2.27 1.79 1.95 1.79
4+ Square feet 1.79 No Bid 2.04 2.03 1.75 1.95 1.79
HIP Three Color
5 0-1 Square feet 191 No Bid 12.79 3.64 2.25 2.20 2.04
1-4 Square feet 1.91 No Bid 3.04 7.03 2.21 2.20 2.04
4+ Square feet 191 No Bid 2.84 2.65 2.16 2.20 2.04
DG3 One Color
7 0-1 Square feet 4.56 No Bid 10.00 5.81 4.43 4.21 3.64
1-4 Square feet 4.56 No Bid 4.67 4.77 4.34 4.21 3.64
4+ Square feet 456 No Bid 4.44 4.68 4.26 4.21 3.64
DG3 Two Color
8 0-1 Square feet 4.67 No Bid 14.00 6.04 4.56 4.46 3.89
1-4 Square feet 4.67 No Bid 4.90 4.98 4.47 4.46 3.89
4+ Square feet 4.67 No Bid 4.67 4.89 4.38 4.46 3.89
DG3 Three Color
9 0-1 Square feet 4.78 No Bid 18.00 6.34 4.69 4.71 4.14
1-4 Square feet 4,78 No Bid 5.13 5.23 4.61 4.71 4.14
4+ Square feet 4,78 No Bid 4.90 5.88 4.52 4.71 4.14
DG3 Three Color
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10 Overlay
30” W3-1 & W3-2 9.20 No Bid 43.69 36.81 51.76 4.96 4,71
36” W3-1 & W3-2 9.20 No Bid 62.91 52.45 51.76 4.96 4.71
30” W3-5 7.84 No Bid 43.69 36.81 51.76 4.96 4.71
36”7 W3-5 7.84 No Bid 62.91 52.45 51.76 4.96 4,71
DG3 One Color
11 | 0-1 Square feet 4.68 No Bid 11.50 5.81 4.86 4.31 3.64
1-4 Square feet 4.68 No Bid 4.77 4.77 4.77 4.31 3.64
4+ Square feet 4.68 No Bid 4.54 4.68 4.66 4.31 3.64
DG3 Two Color
12 | 0-1 Square feet 4.79 No Bid 15.80 6.04 5.01 4.56 3.89
1-4 Square feet 4.79 No Bid 5.00 4.98 4,91 4.56 3.89
4+ Square feet 4.79 No Bid 4,77 4.89 4.82 4.56 3.89
DG3 Three Color
13 0-1 Square feet 8.21 No Bid 20.20 6.34 5.46 4.81 4.14
1-4 Square feet 8.21 No Bid 5.23 5.23 5.08 4.81 4.14
4+ Square feet 8.21 No Bid 5.00 5.88 4,98 4.81 4.14
DG3 Three Color
Overlay
14 | 0-1 Square feet 11.08 No Bid 9.49 5.88 6.02 5.38 4.71
1-4 Square feet 11.08 No Bid 9.49 5.88 591 5.38 4,71
4+ Square feet 11.08 No Bid 9.49 5.88 5.78 5.38 471
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SUBJECT TO FINAL APPROVAL




