BASIS OF AWARD

Category 1
Description

606-5148: Resetting Corrugated Beam Guide Railing
(New Posts)

606-5148: Resetting Corrugated Beam Guide Railing
(New Extra-Long Posts)

606.53: Resetting Box Beam Guide Railing

606.5348: Resetting Box Beam Guide Railing
(New Posts)

606.5348: Resetting Box Beam Guide Railing
(New Extra-Long Posts)

Category 2
Description
606.10: Box Beam Guide Railing
606.100001: Box Beam Guide Railing (Shop Curved)

606.16: Corrugated Beam Guide Railing

606.16001: Corrugated Beam Guide Railing (Shop
Curved)

606.1601: Corrugated Beam Guide Railing With Extra-
Long Posts

606.22: Anchorage Units forCorrugated Beam Guide
Railing

BID TABULATION
BID NO: 260029

HWAY 26-01 Guiderail Installation

Quantity
1.00

1.00

1.00
1.00

1.00

Category 1 Total

Quantity
1.00
1.00

1.00
1.00

1.00

1.00

Category 2 Total

Unit
FOOT

FOOT

FOOT
FOOT

FOOT

Unit
FOOT
FOOT

FOOT
FOOT

FOOT

FOOT

CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP

Unit Price

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

Unit Price
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

SUBJECT TO FINAL APPROVAL

Sub Total
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

Sub Total
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

TOWN & COUNTY BRIDGE

& RAIL, INC

Unit Price Sub Total
27.50 27.50
35.65 35.65
29.00 29.00
37.00 37.00
43.00 43.00
172.15 172.15

Unit Price Sub Total
14.35 14.35
16.25 16.25
12.75 12.75
14.25 14.25
15.25 15.25
1,197.00 1,197.00
1,269.85 1,269.85



	Bid Tabulations

