

TALLY # 1 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

July 1, 2019 - December 31, 2019

ITEM	HILL & MARKES			THE GLOVE BOX			INTERBORO			COOPER FRIEDMAN ELECTRIC			W.B. MASON			NYSID		
	ITEM NUMBER	container size/sheets per roll/# per case	PRICE PER CASE	ITEM NUMBER	container size/sheets per roll/# per case	PRICE PER CASE	ITEM NUMBER	container size/sheets per roll/# per case	PRICE PER CASE	ITEM NUMBER	container size/sheets per roll/# per case	PRICE PER CASE	ITEM NUMBER	container size/sheets per roll/# per case	PRICE PER CASE	ITEM NUMBER	container size/sheets per roll/# per case	PRICE PER CASE
Roll Toilet Tissue - 2 ply, ind. Wrap, 100% Recycled	CASB040	96/500/CS	28.80						NB				ALM248	96/500/CT	21.67	D4409	96/500/CS	42.62
Jumbo Roll Toilet Tissue - 1450' roll - 2" core - 2 ply - to fit a T-Tork Single Roll Dispenser	SCATJ0922A	12RL/1000/ CS	40.10						NB				NO BID					
Center Pull Towel - 600' roll - 2 ply - to fit a M-Tork Dispenser	SCARC530	6/600/CS	49.01						NB				NO BID					
Large Plastic Trash Bags - clear, 100lb dry / 75lb wet, approx size: 33 x 40, heavy duty (at least 1 mil), on a roll, Cases must be 500 or more, SAMPLE PLEASE	FORCRHD33 40H	33"X40" 13MIC, 500/CS	24.35				INT-3340-H,	100/Case	\$6.24/100				NO BID					
X-Large Plastic Trash Bags - clear, 40+ gal, approx size: 40 x 63, heavy duty (at least 1 mil), on a roll, Cases must be 500 or more, SAMPLE PLEASE	FORCL48H	40"X46", 1.1mil, 100/CS	19.29				INT-4060-X-Hvy	100/Case	\$17.24/100				NO BID			D4363	100/roll1 1rl/cs	27.29
Medium Plastic Trash Bags - clear, 20-30 gal, approx size: 30 x 37, heavy duty, on a roll (at least 1 mil), Cases must be 500 or more, SAMPLE PLEASE	FORCRLD37 XHC	30"X36" 0.9mil, 250/CS	22.85				INT-3037-Hvy	100/Case	\$4.94/100				NO BID					
Small Plastic Trash Bags - clear, 24 x 24, heavy duty (at least 1 mil), on a roll, Cases must be 500 or more, SAMPLE PLEASE	FOR113195	**100 CASE MINIMUM ORDER REQUIREMENT** 24"X23", 1.25mil, 500/CS	32.97				INT-2424-Hvy	1,000/Case	\$0.0198/Bag \$19.84/1,000				NO BID					
Cups: 1oz medicine, clear, graduated, non-sterile	POL162000	50/100/CS	41.25						NB				CSWMC5000	5000/CS	0.0044/ 22.00/case			
Cups: 5oz cold, 2 7/8"H x 1 1/2" base	FABRK5	25/100/CS	27.79						NB				CSWC5OZCPP2 500	2500/CT	0.0101/ 25.25/case			
Cups: 7oz cold, plastic, Dart Conex # 7N25 or equal	FABRK7	25/100/CS	35.09						NB				CSWD7OZPPC1 200	1200/CS	0.0092/ 11.04/case			

TALLY # 1 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
July 1, 2019 - December 31, 2019

Cups: 8oz hot/cold, styrofoam DC8J8	DRT8J8	25/40/CS	19.67										DCC8J8	1000/CT	0.0203/20.3 0/case			
Furniture Polish / aerosol, Pledge , or equal, Provide Sample if equal product	CLRCS232 - SAMPLE AVAILABLE UPON REQUEST IF LOW BID	CLAIRE SPRAY SHINE FURNITURE POLISH 12/17OZ/CS	25.60										NB	NCL2007	12/18oz/CS	32.80		
Multi Surface Dusting & Cleaning, Endust , or equal, Provide Sample & Specs if equal product	ECO6196291	6/15OZ/CS	25.47										NB	SJN652989	6/9.7oz/CT	31.14		
Wood Cleaner/Polish, 2 in 1, Orange Glo or equal, 32 oz, Provide sample if equal product	NO BID	NO BID											NB	NO BID				
Everyday Cleaner, Hardwood & Laminate Floor, Orange Glo , or equal, 32 oz, Provide sample if equal product	SMZP266600 4 - SAMPLE AVAILABLE UPON REQUEST IF LOW BID	SIMONIZ AP-7 NEUTRAL FLOOR CLEANER, LEMON 4/1GL/CS	16.10										NB	NO BID				
Stainless Steel Cleaner, oil based - 16-18 oz	CLRCS227	12/14OZ/CS	23.82										NB	BWK347AEA	12/18oz	33.72		
Liquid Disinfectant/Cleaner (non- abrasive) Comet or equal, 32 oz NOT CRÈME	PNG02287	8/32OZ/CS	44.60										NB	PGC02287CT	8/32oz	41.35		
Roll Paper Towel/Perf, , sample please - WHITE - RECYCLED	CASK085	CASCADES HOUSEHOLD ROLL TOWEL, 2-PLY, WHITE, 100% RECYCLED 30/85/CS	17.15										NB	BWK6272	30/85/CT	0.57/17.10/ case		
Roll Paper Towel/Perf, good quality, sample please - BROWN - RECYCLED	MORR6800	MORCON 8" BROWN ROLL TOWEL, 6/800/CS	14.90										NB	CSWHRTK6800	6/800/CT	2.49/14.94/ case		

TALLY # 1 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
July 1, 2019 - December 31, 2019

Roll Paper Towel - equal to Brawny or Bounty	GPF27385	PREFERENCE HOUSEHOLD TOWEL 30/85SHT/CS	27.89																
Ammonia	KIK19703575033	8/64OZ/CS	14.50						NB					TRKHB1990	30/84sh/CT	23.26			
Bleach - Clorox , or equal	CLX30966	3/121OZ/CS	14.50						NB					KIK11008635042	6GL/CT	2.18/13.085 /case	D4726	4gl/cs	28.36
Oxiclean , 25lb tub	SMZC0597050	SIMONIZ CLOTHESLINE LAUNDRY POWDER, 50LB BOX	21.63						NB					BWKHURACAN 40	40lb	13.61/25lb, 21.77/40lb			
Gloves - Powder Free - Vinyl - Exam (Small)	ISL102112	10/100/CS	27.75	2392	100/BX, 10BX/CS	21.00	Med Pride/Elara-Small-VPFG-E	1,000/Case	\$18.20/1,000	PIP 64-435PF/S	10 BOXES PER CASE	\$ 48.80	CSWVECPFGS	100/BX	17.20	C3318	10bxs/cs	39.35	
Gloves - Powder Free - Vinyl - Exam (Medium)	ISL102114	10/100/CS	27.75	2393	100/BX, 10BX/CS	21.00	Med Pride/Elara-Medium-VPFG-E	1,000/Case	\$18.20/1,000	PIP 64-435PF/M	10 BOXES PER CASE	\$ 48.80	CSWVECPFGM	100/BX	17.20	C3318	10bxs/cs	39.35	
Gloves - Powder Free - Vinyl - Exam (Large)	ISL102116	10/100/CS	27.75	2394	100/BX, 10BX/CS	21.00	Med Pride/Elara-Large-VPFG-E	1,000/Case	\$18.20/1,000	PIP 64-435PF/L	10 BOXES PER CASE	\$ 48.80	CSWVECPFGL	100/BX	17.20	C3318	10bxs/cs	39.35	
Gloves - Powder Free - Vinyl - Exam (X-Large)	ISL102118	10/100/CS	27.75	2395	100/BX, 10BX/CS	21.00	Med Pride/Elara-X-Large	1,000/Case	\$18.20/1,000	PIP 64-435PF/XL	10 BOXES PER CASE	\$ 48.80	CSWVECPFGXL	100/BX	17.20	C3318	10bxs/cs	39.35	
Gloves - Powder Free - Latex (Small)	ISL100212	10/100/CS	32.10	060-6	100/BX, 10BX/CS	37.10	First Care/Job Guard-Small-LPFG	1,000/Case	\$34.00/1,000	PIP 62-327PF/S	10BOXES PER CASE	\$ 47.60	CSWLGPFGS	1000/CS	27.37	C3317	10bxs/cs	56.15	
Gloves - Powder Free - Latex (Medium)	ISL100214	10/100/CS	32.10	060-7	100/BX, 10BX/CS	37.10	First Care/Job Guard-Medium-LPFG	1,000/Case	\$34.00/1,000	PIP 62-327PF/M	10 BOXES PER CASE	\$ 47.60	CSWLGPFGM	1000/CS	27.37	C3317	10bxs/cs	56.15	

TALLY # 1 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
July 1, 2019 - December 31, 2019

Gloves - Powder Free - Latex (Large)	ISL100216	10/100/CS	32.10	060-8	100/BX, 10BX/CS	37.10	First Care/Job Guard-Large-LPFG	1,000/Case	\$34.00/1,000	PIP 62-327PF/L	10 BOXES PER CASE	\$ 47.60	CSWLGPPFGL	1000/CS	27.37	C3317	10bxs/cs	56.15
Gloves - Powder Free - Latex (X-Large)	ISL100218	10/100/CS	32.10	068-9	100/BX, 10BX/CS	37.10	First Care/Job Guard-X-Large-LPFG	1,000/Case	\$34.00/1,000	PIP 62-327PF/XL	10 BOXES PER CASE	\$ 47.60	CSWLGPPFGXL	1000/CS	27.37	C3317	10bxs/cs	56.15
Gloves - Powder Free - Nitrile - Exam (Small)	ISL103212AP	4/250/CS	40.80	00748705	250/BX, 4BX/CS	29.41	First Care-Small-NPFG-E	1,000/Case	\$33.40/1,000	PIP 63-332PF/S	10 BOXES PER CASE	\$ 79.00	CSWNEBPFGS	100/BX	31.60	C3322	10bxs/cs	69.57
Gloves - Powder Free - Nitrile - Exam (Medium)	ISL103214AP	4/250/CS	40.80	00748706	250/BX, 4BX/CS	29.41	First Care-Medium-NPFG-E	1,000/Case	\$33.40/1,000	PIP 63-332PF/M	10 BOXES PER CASE	\$ 79.00	CSWNEBPFGM	100/BX	31.60	C3322	10bxs/cs	69.57
Gloves - Powder Free - Nitrile - Exam (Large)	ISL103216AP	4/250/CS	40.80	00748707	250/BX, 4BX/CS	29.41	First Care-Large-NPFG-E	1,000/Case	\$33.40/1,000	PIP 63-332PF/L	10 BOXES PER CASE	\$ 79.00	CSWNEBPFGGL	100/BX	31.60	C3322	10bxs/cs	69.57
Gloves - Powder Free - Nitrile - Exam (X-Large)	ISL103218AP	4/250/CS	40.80	00748708	250/BX, 4BX/CS	29.41	First Care-X-Large-NPFG-E	1,000/Case	\$33.40/1,000	PIP 63-332PF/XL	10 BOXES PER CASE	\$ 79.00	CSWNEBPFGXL	100/BX	31.60	C3322	10bxs/cs	69.57
Plunger	BWK09201EA	18" PLASTIC HANDLE, 5-5/8" DIA. BOWL 1/EA	4.15						NB				BWK09201EA	1/EA	3.54			
Toilet Brush with Holder	RUB6310 + RUB6311	BRUSH \$2.47 HOLDER \$2.18	4.65						NB	RUBBERMAID FG63100WHT & FG631100WHT		2.45E	RCP631000WE & RCP631100WE	1/EA	3.38			
Brooms, corn maids	OCD61036	1EA	5.05						NB	RUBBERMAID FG638300BLUE		10.00E	COCPE502028	1/EA	6.64			
Brooms, Angled, 12" Polypropylene Bristle, w/Vinyl Coated Handle	OCD6410	11" BLACK METAL HANDLE 1EA	4.45						NB	RUBBERMAID FG638906BLA		4.95E	BWK932AEA	1/EA	6.45			
Push Broom w/Non-Wood Handle - 2' wide	NO BID	NO BID							NB				BWK20624 & BWK636	1/EA	16.97			

TALLY # 1 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
July 1, 2019 - December 31, 2019

Push Broom w/Non-Wood Handle - 4' wide	NO BID	NO BID							NB				NO BID					
Air Deodorizer - Simonize Eliminator or equal - Provide Sample & Specs if equal product	SMZL210701 2	12/1QT/CS	21.80						NB				NCL142836	12QT/CS	41.52			
Air Freshener - 9.7 oz - Febreze Air Effects or equal	PGC96255	FEBREEZE AIR, MEADOWS & RAIN 6/8.8OZ/CS	18.00						NB				PGC96255	1/EA	20.64			
Spray Disinfectant, 16.5 oz, Chase or equal	CLX38504	CLOROX SPRAY DISINFECTANT 12/19OZ/CS	45.73						NB				CHP34104	1/EA	21.48	Purell D4098	3- 32oz bottles	28.04
Odor Absorbing Gel - assorted scents - 8 oz - Natural Magic , or equal	WMN4119DE A	WEIMAN ODOR ABSORBING GEL CITRUS, 14OZ JAR	5.50						NB				BRI900114EA	1/EA	3.82			
Universal Telescopic Window Squeegee Pole - 4-8'	UNGEP24R	1/EA	32.50						NB				COCP255008	3/CT	20.46			
Bi-Level Deck Scrub Brush - 10" - stiff crimped polypropylene bristles - 60" wood handle	OCD27190 + OCD7160	BRUSH \$3.28 HANDLE \$2.42	5.70						NB	RUBBERMAID FG633700BL UE & FG636100LA C	8.65E		COCP1004000 & COCPM101060	12/DZ	9.33			
Mop Head - 8 oz - THIN BAND ONLY - (nylon or blend for waxing)	NO BID	NO BID							NB				NO BID					
Mop Head - 16 oz - THIN BAND ONLY	TUWGENBLL 16B	16OZ BLUE BLEND LOOP MOP 12/CS	55.95						NB	RUBBERMAID FGV11600W H00	12	28.92 DOZ	RLBV04230	6/CT	11.12/6, 22.24/12			
Mop Head - 20 oz - THIN BAND ONLY	TUWGENSO2 024	20OZ STAR COTTON CUT END MOP 12/CS	34.49						NB	RUBBERMAID FGV11700W H00	12	33.72 DOZ	RLBV04342	6/CT	12.98/6, 25.96/12			

TALLY # 1 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
July 1, 2019 - December 31, 2019

Cotton Wall Mop Pad 5" x 8 1/2" - Geerpres # 9502 or equal	NO BID	NO BID							NB				NO BID				
Microfiber Wall Wash Mop Pad - 5" x 10 1/2" - Backing: velcro style loop	TUWMMS9G WL - 2-3 WEEK LEAD TIME	9" GREEN/WHITE MF PAD 12/CS	38.18						NB				NO BID				
Handle for above Microfiber Wall Wash Mop	TUWPTZ9	9" WALL WASH HAND TOWEL FRAME 6/CS	35.25						NB				NO BID				
Wet Mop - Heavy Duty - Washable - 4 ply - 8 oz	NO BID	NO BID							NB				NO BID				
Wet Mop - Heavy Duty - Washable - 4 ply - 12 oz	TUWDOL125 PK3	3/CS	8.75						NB				NO BID				
Wet Mop - Heavy Duty - Washable - 4 ply - 16 oz	TUWDOL165 PK3	3/CS	9.45						NB				RLBV04333	6/CT	2.99/ea, 17.94/6		
Commercial Rectangle Down Press Mop Bucket w/Wringer - 20 qt - Rubbermaid FGQ93000Blue or equal - Provide Sample & Specs if equal product	RUBFG75778 8YEL - 2-3 WEEK LEAD TIME	35QT DOWN PRESS MOP BUCKET & WRINGER 1/EA	135.20						NB	RUBBERMAID FGQ93000BLUE	82.50E		NO BID				
Side Press Mop Bucket w/Wringer - 26 qt - Rubbermaid FG748000Yel or equal - Provide Sample & Specs if equal product	OCD96988 - 23 WEEK LEAD TIME	26QT MOP BUCKET & WRINGER COMBO 1EA	43.50						NB	RUBBERMAID FG748000YEL	49.51E		NO BID				
Murphy's Oil - liquid soap, or equal	CPL1103	4/1GAL/CS	51.85						NB				CPC01103EA	1/EA	55.24/4		
Bully crème cleanser - qt	SMZG132501 2	SIMONIZ GENTLE TOUCH CREAM CLEANSER 12/32OZ/CS	20.12						NB				NCL172545	12/CS	26.24		
Digest - gal - or equal - Provide Sample & Specs if equal product	SMZD086000 4	4/1GL/CS	25.25						NB				NCL180029	4GL/CS	31.11	D4510 liq-bac	4gl/cs 49.93

TALLY # 1 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
July 1, 2019 - December 31, 2019

Powder Cleanser - Comet, or equal Provide Sample & Specs if equal product	CPL4278 - SAMPLE AVAILABLE IF LOW BIDDER	AJAX POWDER CLEANSER 24/21OZ/CS	23.40																	NB			CALICCP752088	24/21oz/CT	24.35							
Simple Green - gallon or equal - Provide Sample & Specs if equal product	SMZC059500 4 - SAMPLE AVAILABLE IF LOW BIDDER	SIMONIZ STRYKE FORCE 4/1GAL/CS	21.90																	NB			SMP13005CT	6GL/CT	18.91							
Bissell - Carpet Shampoo, or equal Provide Sample & Specs if equal product	SMZP266900 4 - SAMPLE AVAILABLE IF LOW BIDDER	SIMONIZ PICK UP EXTRACTION CLEANER 4/1GAL/CS	20.17																	NB			CALISZP266900 4	4GL/CT	26.02							
Spray Bottles - 32oz	IMP5032WG	1/EA	0.49																	NB	RUBBERMAI D FG9C030600 00				2.15E	TOL120125	1/EA	0.38				
Trigger Sprayers	IMP4902	1/EA	0.39																	NB			TOL110246	1/EA	0.32							
Mop Handles	OCD6511	1/EA	5.90																	NB			BWK620	1/EA	5.91							
Floor Wax - gal, Wet Look or equal	SMZCS07400 04 - 2-3 WEEK LEAD TIME	WET LOOK FLOOR FINISH & SEALER 4/1GAL/CS	34.90																	NB			CALISZCS07500 04	4GL/CT	12.57/ea, 50.28/4							
Floor Stripper - gal	SMZR302500 4 - 2-3 WEEK LEAD TIME	RELEASE WAX STRIPPER 4/1GAL/CS	24.25																	NB			CALISZR302500 4	4GL/CT	7.26/ea, 29.84/4	D4508 enviro care	4gl/cs					47.94
Floor Finish - gal, Simonize Super Sealer or equal	SMZCS07400 04 - 2-3 WEEK LEAD TIME	WET LOOK FLOOR FINISH & SEALER 4/1GAL/CS	34.90																	NB			NCL052329	4GL/CS	11.17/ea, 44.68/4	D4507 enviro care	4gl/cs					59.60
Cleaner/Degreaser - Simonize AP7, container size: gallon, or equal	SMZP266600 4	4/1GAL/CS	16.10																	NB			NCL090129	4GL/CS	18.19	D4501 enviro care	4gl/cs					44.04

TALLY # 1 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

July 1, 2019 - December 31, 2019

Cleaner/Degreaser - Simonize Strike Force or equal, container size: Quart	SMZC059501 2	12QT/CS	18.50											NCL107136	12QT/CS	20.84	D4526 Proxi	6- 32oz bottles	32.13
GOJO Deluxe Lotion Hand Soap 2L # 2217 - dispensers supplied free of charge	GJ221704	4/2000mL/CS	53.41											GOJ2217	4/2L/CT	\$ 48.82	D4074 #5362-02	2- 1200ml	53.30
Dispenser for # 2217 - FREE	GJ223008	ONLY SOLD 8/CS	FREE WITH AWARD OF SOAP											GOJ2230	1/EA	N/C	D4091		FREE
Liquid Hand Soap Simonize Phlo Off or equal, for dispensers (gal)	SMZCS02500 4	4/1GAL/CS	17.35											NCL34529	4GL/CS	5.41/ea, 21.64/4			
Hand Sanitizers Purell 9656/9657 , or equal	GJ965606	6/800mL/CS	58.95											GOJ965606CT	6/800ML/CT	56.20	D4056	12- 800ml	97.40
Hand Sanitizers Foam 5392 , or equal	GJ539202	2/1200mL/CS	64.00											GOJ539202CT	2/1200ML/CT	55.56	D4058 Purell	3- 1200ml	53.94
Liquid (HE) Laundry Detergent - 100 oz, Tide , or equal	SMZW420004	WASH PLUS LAUNDRY DETERGENT 4/1GAL/CS	19.54											PGC08886	4GL/CT	65.46			
Electrolux Type U / Prolux Vacuum Bags - 100/cs	[APCJANELU 2	ELECTROLUX VACUUM FILTER BAGS TYPE U 100/CS	72.50											APCJANELU2	200/CT	0.51/ea, 51.00/100			
Mighty Mite - Type MM vacuum bags	NO BID	NO BID												EUR63253A10	5/PK	1.18/ea, 5.90/5			
Sanitaire Vacuum Bags - UP-1 - 9100, C4900	NO BID	NO BID												NO BID					
Sanitaire Vacuum Bags - SD - P1/6600	[EUR63262B1 0	SD PREMIUM ALLERGAN VACUUM BAGS 10/PK	6.79											EUR63262B10CT	50/CT	0.9/ea, 45.00/50			
Vacuum Cleaner Scent Tabs - Style 515	NILAS00305	NILAROMA DEODORIZER VACUUM DISC 8/12/CS	71.80											NO BID					

TALLY # 1 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
July 1, 2019 - December 31, 2019

Ecolab TriStar Flexylight Laundry Soap # 16326	ECO6116326	5GL PAIL	120.84						NB																		
Ecolab Neutral Floor Cleaner # 6100035	ECO6100035	2/2L/CS	58.02						NB									D4504 enviro care	4g/l/cs	48.69							
Ecolab Heavy Duty Bathroom Cleaner Disinfectant # 10158	ECO6110158	2/2L/CS	84.22						NB									D4506 enviro care	4g/l/cs	55.14							
Ecolab Orange Force # 21038	ECO6121038	2/2L/CS	57.89						NB																		
Ecolab Revitalize Encapsulation Carpet Cleaner - 1 gal # 61495099	ECO6195099	4/1GL/CS	94.53						NB																		
Ecolab Solid Surge Plus # 17905	ECO6117905	4/9LB/CS	197.71						NB																		
Ecolab All Purpose Cleaner # 14205	ECO6100912	2/2L/CS	144.56						NB																		
Ecolab Solid Navisoft # 16001	ECO6116001	2/6LB/CS	122.48						NB																		
Ecolab Stain Away # 13649	ECO6100975	ECOLAB LOW TEMP LAUNDRY SOLID 2/4LB/CS	54.24						NB																		
Disposable Multipurpose Rags, 10" x 12", 200/bx - Scott Rags In A Box or equal	KIM05800	800/CS	34.95						NB																		
Shop Rags - 100% cotton - 14x14 - 60/bx - Uline # S-7288 or equal	HSP34025	25LB/CS (APPROX. 180EA/CS)	41.20						NB																		
Terry Cloth Cleaning Rags - 14x17, 25 lb - Hospesco #534-25 or equal	HSP53425	14X17, 25LB/CS (APPROX 200/CS)	43.50						NB																		
General Purpose Scouring Pad - 6" x 9", 3M or equal	DSCMD69	DISCO MEDIUM DUTY PAD 6/10/CS	10.95						NB																		

TALLY # 1 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
July 1, 2019 - December 31, 2019

Glass Cleaner - Windex or equal	SMZ08012	SIMONIZ GLASS CLEANER 12/32OZ/CS	16.00							NB				SMZB0400004	4GL/CT	15.41	D4502 enviro care	4gl/cs	39.20
Revitalize Miracle Spotter # 6101125 or equal	ECO6101125	4/22OZ/CS	190.11							NB				NO BID					
Antibacterial Foam Soap - 1250 ml - # 5162	GJE5162EXL	3/1250mL/CS	47.40							NB				GOJ516203CT	3/1250ML/CT	44.93	D4078 GOJO	3- 1250ml	47.38
<i>Dispenser for Antibacterial Foam Soap - 1250 ml - FREE</i>	GJ515506EX L	1/EA								NB				GOJ515506	1/EA	79.56/6, 13.26/ea	D4088		FREE
Snapback Spray Buff , Floor Cleaner or equal size: Gallon	PIO211MPE	PIONEER REBOUND CLEANER ENHANCER 4/1.06GL/CS	31.10							NB				NCL52029	1 GL	21.12	D4505 enviro care	4gl/cs	41.70
MPC All-Surf - All Purpose Cleaner or equal	SMZP266600 4	SIMONIZ AP-7 NEUTRAL FLOOR CLEANER, LEMON 4/1GL/CS	16.10							NB				NCL090129	4GL/CS	18.57	D4122 Proxi	4gl/cs	75.86
Simonize Freedom Bowl Cleaner - 4/gal or equal	SMZF123101 2	12/32OZ/C S	15.05							NB				NCL171529	12QT/CS	29.19/4GAL , 21.89/12QT	D4506 enviro care	4gl/cs	55.14
Magic Erasers (Mr. Clean) or equal	PNG82027	6/4/CS	20.62							NB				BWK400BX	10/BX	6.71	D4715	24/cs	12.19
Lint Rollers - 12/cs	NO BID	NO BID								NB				MMM836RS56T PP	2/PK	25.44/12, 4.24/2			
Enmotion Towels - Brown - 6/800/cs	GPF89480	6/800/CS	49.20							NB				GPC89480	6/800/CT	45.67			
Enmotion Towels - White - 6/800/cs	GPF89460	6/800/CS	50.65							NB				GPC89460	6/800/CT	48.04			
Sanitary Napkin Receptacle - approx 10" x 7" x3"	IMP1102	10.625"X9"X4.6 5" 1/EA	12.62							NB				RUBBERMAI D FG614000WH T	1 EA	18.18E 23.02			

TALLY # 1 - JANITORIAL SUPPLIES
 July 1, 2019 - December 31, 2019

Sanitary Napkin Receptacle Liner - 10" x 7" x3", 500/cs	HSP260	500/CS	13.40						NB	RUBBERMAI D FG614100000 0	250 IN CASE	14.05E	HOS260	500/CT	15.47			
MINIMUM ORDER TO AVOID SHIPPING FEES				4 CS in any combination														

TALLY# 2 - FOOD SERVICE SUPPLIES

July 1, 2019 - December 31, 2019

HILL & MARKES

W.B. MASON

NYSID

ITEM	ITEM NUMBER	NUMBER PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	ITEM NUMBER	NUMBER PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE	ITEM NUMBER	NUMBER PER CASE	PRICE PER CASE
All-Purpose Liquid Cleaner - gal	SMZP2666004	4/1GAL/CS	16.10	NCL090129	4GL/CS	18.19			
Aluminum Foil 18" x 500'	WES294	ROLL	14.85	CSWF18500SD	1 RL	12.89			
Apron Plastic	ISL250011	10/100/CS	50.25	CSWAPIW24421000	1000/CS	2.89/100, 28.90/1000			
Bib Apron - Clear Vinyl - 45x36 - 12/pkg	NO BID	NO BID		WEB167RA08C48	1 each	1.95/EA, 23.40/12			
Bags -10# Elephant	DUO71010	400/BL	17.32	BAGGX10500	500/BD	24.20			
Bags -10# Brown	DUO80985	500/BL	11.81	BAGGK10500	500/BD	11.44			
Bags - 8# Brown Paper	DUO80984	500/BL	11.11	BAGGK8500	500/BD	12.18			
Bags - 6# White - waxed	PPC300296	1000/CS	47.33	BGC300296	1000/CT	47.52			
Bags - 6# White	DUO81223	500/BL	12.55	BAGGW6500	500/BD	15.23			
Bags - 6# Brown	DUO80983	500/BL	9.64	DUM18406	500/BD	8.91			
Bags - 4# Brown Paper	DUO81007	500/BL	7.84	BAGGK4500	500/BD	8.30			
Garbage Bags - 30-33 gal - Heavy	FORCRHD3340H	33X40, 13MIC, 500/CS	24.35	HERZ6640MNR01	500/CT	23.85			
Garbage Bags - 56 gal - Black - Heavy Duty	FORRL3646XH	36X46 1.2MIL BLACK LINER 100/CS	15.81	HERZ8648VKR01	200/CT	19.90			
Garbage Bags - 56 gal - Clear - Heavy Duty	FORHBH6055SH	37X55 HYBRID LINER .55MIL 200/CS	21.74	HERZ8648VN	200/CT	19.90			

TALLY# 2 - FOOD SERVICE SUPPLIES
July 1, 2019 - December 31, 2019

Poly Bags - 6 x 3 x 15	FOR110NP	1000/CS	10.33	ELK6G063015	1000/CS	11.71			
Poly Bags - 10 x 18 x 24	FOR152NP M	10X8X24 500/CS	17.80	ELK8G108024	1000/CS	23.46			
Sandwich Bags - #130 wax	PPC300404	6/1000/CS	13.55	BGC300404BX	1000/BX	13.03			
Sandwich Bags - plastic	ISL2001	3/2000/CS	18.70	IBSPB675675	2000/CT	6.21			
Zip Lock Bags - gallon	ISL210912	1000/CS	37.63	LDD3655A	1000/CT	33.07			
Banquet Paper	ROYTCD	40"x300"ROLL	10.27	LRP910000	40"x300"ROLL	10.53			
Bleach - gal	CLX30966	3/121OZ/CS	14.50	KIK110086350 42	6/CT	12.84	D4726	4gl/cs	28.36
Bowl - 5 oz	GEN80500	1000/CS	16.14	DCC5BWWCR	1000/CT	13.94			
Bowl - Styrofoam -10 oz	DRT10B20	20/50/CS	39.05	DCC10B20	1000/CT	39.47			
Bowl Lid -10 oz	DRT20JL	10/100/CS	21.40	DCC20JL	1000/CT	21.62			
Bowl - 12 oz	GEN82100	8/125/CS	13.80	DCC12BWWC R	1000/CT	16.79			
Chlorine Sanitizer Test Strip Kit	NO BID	NO BID		LAC4250BJ	200/TB	5.01			
Coffee Filters - 18 x 7.5 - 3 gal - # BUNU318X7252CS or equal	[BUNU318X 7252CS	252/CT	19.98	BUNU318X725 2CS	252/CT	14.33			
Comet All Purpose Bleach Spray - 32 oz	CLX01698	ANYWHERE	49.50	PGC02287CT	8/32OZ/CT	41.35			
Container - Styrofoam - Hinged - approx. 9 x 9 x 3	GEN200VW	200/CS	13.85	DCC90HT1R	200/CT	15.37			
Container - Styrofoam - Hinged - approx. 6 x 6 x 3	GEN22500	500/CS	18.10	DCC60HT1	500/CT	18.20			
Cotton Cloth - approx. 16" x 18"	NO BID	NO BID		WNCBTW30	12/DZ	4.03			
Cream Cleanser - qt	012	12/32OZ/CS	20.12	NCL172545	12QT/CS	23.13			
Cup - Foam - squat - 4 oz	DRT4J6	20/50/CS	21.02	DCC4J6	1000/CT	21.25			
Cup Lid - Foam - squat - 4 oz	DRT6JL	10/100/CS	12.45	DCC6JL	1000/CT	12.57			

TALLY# 2 - FOOD SERVICE SUPPLIES

July 1, 2019 - December 31, 2019

Cup - Foam - squat - 8 oz	DRT8SJ20	20/50/CS	37.55	DCC8SJ20	1000/CT	37.97			
Cup Lid - Foam - squat - 8 oz	DRT20JL	10/100/CS	21.40	DCC20JL	1000/CT	21.62			
Cup - Hot/Cold, 8 oz - want DC8J8	DRT8J8	25/40/CS	19.67	DCC8J8	1000/CT	19.90			
Cup Lid - Hot/Cold, 8 oz	DRT8JL	10/100/CS	12.75	DCC8JL	1000/CT	12.87			
Cup - Hot/Cold, 14-16 oz	DRT16J16	25/40/CS	40.40	DCC16J16	1000/CT	38.45			
Cup - Paper - 1 oz	GENF100	20/250/CS	28.63	GNPF100	5000/CT	34.47			
Cup - Souffle - 2 oz	SLOB200	10/250/CS	17.30	DCCP200N	2500/CT	17.47			
Cup Lid - Souffle - 2 oz	SLOPL2	25/100/CS	14.50	DCCPL200N	2500/CT	14.49			
Cupcake Liner Papers	REYTW550	5.5" WHITE BAKING CUP 10,000/CS	61.60	HFM610031	10000/CT	44.28			
Deli Container - clear w/lid - 12 oz - rectangular	GENAD12	200/CS	23.85	GNPAD12	200/CT	25.58			
Dinex 8 oz disposable lids for 8 oz Turnbury mugs	DIN300087 75	1000/CS	37.50	NO BID					
Dawn Dish Soap - gallon	PNG57445	4/1GL/CS	56.75	NCL110029	4GL/CS	33.03			
Dishwasher Detergent - Cascade (or equal)	PNG40152	6/75OZ/CS	34.47	PGC59535CT	6/CT	47.54			
Excaliber Sanitizer	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID					
Film - 18" x 500'	ANP730778 2	1 ROLL 18"X2000'	11.36	IBSFSW1802K	1 RL	10.41			
Flash Dri equal to CX8 Rinse Drying Agent - 5 gal pail	SMZC0710 005	5GL PAIL	36.30	NO BID		0.00			
Gloves - latex - small - for food handling	ISL100202	10/100/CS	32.25	CSWLGPPTS	1000/CS	24.23	C3316	1000/cs	48.04
Gloves - latex - medium - for food handling	ISL100204	10/100/CS	32.25	CSWLGPPTM	1000/CS	24.23	C3316	1000/cs	48.04

TALLY# 2 - FOOD SERVICE SUPPLIES

July 1, 2019 - December 31, 2019

Gloves - latex - large - for food handling	ISL100206	10/100/CS	32.25	CSWLGPPL	1000/CS	24.23	C3316	1000/cs	48.04
Gloves - plastic - for food handling	ISL104GB(2-6)	10/1000/CS	55.25	CSWPMD1010100	10000/CS	32.47	C3427	1000/cs	9.51
Hair Nets - about 24"	FDI109HP124BN	24" BROWN 10/100/CS	55.50	CSWSBC24W1000	1000/CS	18.04			
Hair Nets - larger than 24"	FDIHN500BR	28" DARK BROWN 10/144/1CS	70.60	NO BID					
Heavy Duty Floor Cleaner (liquid)	SMZB0320004	4/1GL/CS	16.58	NCL100129	4GL/CS	18.52	D4667 concentrate	6gl/cs	50.48
Ice Bags - Empty - 5 lb	FOR127NP EXH	8X4X18 POLY BAG CLEAR XHVY 500/CS	28.54	ELKH18PMET	100/CS	40.33			
Laundry Detergent - liquid	SMZW420004	4/1GL/CS	19.54	CALISZL2148004	4GL/CT	24.70	D4501 concentrate	4gl/cs	44.04
Laundry Detergent - powder	SMZC0597050	50LB	21.63	BWKHURACAN40	40 LB PAIL	21.38			
Lime Away	SMZL2125004	4/1GL/CS	23.28	NCL112629	4GL/CS	32.45			
Napkins - 1 ply	MOR1250MS	6000/CS	23.57	CSWLN12500	6000/CS	22.68	B2913	6000/cs	34.50
Pan Liners - 16.375" x 24.375"	PPC030001	1000/CS	37.95	GENLINE R	1000/CT	30.58			
Paper Place Mats (white)	SNF150	1000/CS	14.10	LMILP100	1000/CT	9.64			
Paper Place Mats (green)	SNF6025	1000/CS	15.85	HFM310528	1000/CT	21.14			
Paper Place Mats (red)	SNF6005	1000/CS	15.85	HFM310521	1000/CT	22.69			
Paper Towels - Brown - roll for Towel Master	GPF26490	6/1150'/CS	61.05	GPC26490	6/1150'/CT	62.58	D4006	6 rolls, 800ft ea	20.29/cs
Paper Towels - White - roll	CASK085	30/85/CS	17.15	BWK6272	30RL/CS	17.10			

TALLY# 2 - FOOD SERVICE SUPPLIES

July 1, 2019 - December 31, 2019

Plastic Forks (bulk)	NPP406010	1000/CS	4.73	000	1000/CS	5.00	B2921	1000/cs	18.68
Plastic Knives (bulk)	NPP406017	1000/CS	4.73	1000	1000/CS	5.00	B2920	1000/cs	18.68
Plastic Spoons (bulk)	NPP406014	1000/CS	4.73	1000	1000/CS	5.00	B2922	1000/cs	18.68
Plastic Wrap - 18" x 2,000'	ANP7307782	ROLL	11.36	IBSFSW1802K	1 RL	10.41			
Plates - paper - 6"	ASP10106	10/100/CS	10.25	SGV421278	1000/CS	11.19			
Plates - paper - 9"	ASP121005	12/100/CS	20.05	SGV4212860	1000/CT	15.98			
Plates - styrofoam - 9"	GEN80900	4/125/CS	12.95	GNP80900	500/CT	14.16			
Plates - styrofoam - 10.25"	GEN81000	500/CS	27.70	DCC10PWCR	500/CT	20.77			
Powder Cleaner - qt	CAL752088	24/21OZ/CS	26.75	88	24/21oz/CT	23.85			
Sacks 1/6	DUO80076	500/CS	36.30	BAGSK1652	500/BD	33.75			
Scotch Brite Pads	DSCMD69	DISCO MEDIUM DUTY PAD 6/10/CS	10.95	BSDJAN3096	10/BX	1.80	D4701	60/cs	16.86
Speedball Cleaner	SMZC0595 012	SIMONIZ STRYKE FORCE 12/QT/CS	18.50	NCL107136	12QT/CS	20.41			
Stainless Steel Scrubber	ROYS7756	6/12/CS	38.10	PME75004292	72/CT	18.23			
Tray - aluminum - 3 compartment HDM	PACY7139TP	200/CS	36.42	0	250/CS	31.19			
Water Test Strips (7347636) QUAQR	NO BID	NO BID		LAC2951	100/TB	4.79			
Wypalls x 60	KIM34015	180/CS	12.25	LGCG6202X	180/CS	10.31			
Zappers all purpose towels - blue	CHX8725	DURAWIPE CREPED CLEANING TOWEL 12X12 400/CS	35.96	LGCG8212X	160/CS	17.63			
3 compartment tray with heat film (Oliver 7230-6100)	OLV2103	600/CS	169.13	NO BID					
32 oz spray bottle	IMP5032WG	1/EA	0.49	TOL120125	1 EA	0.38			
Trigger sprayer for 32 oz bottle	IMP4902	1/EA	0.39	COCP902RW9	1 EA	0.32			

TALLY# 2 - FOOD SERVICE SUPPLIES

July 1, 2019 - December 31, 2019

Ecolab Products									
Apex Dishwasher Solid - # 17062	ECO6117062	6/6.75LB/CS	112.47	NO BID					
Fast Foam Degreaser - # 10126	ECO6110126	6/32OZ/CS	47.32	NO BID					
Solid Power XL - # 6100185	ECO6100185	4/9LB/CS	102.73	NO BID					
Oasis 115 XP Floor Cleaner - # 10625	ECO6110625	2.5GL	41.54	NO BID					
Oasis 100 Neutral All Purpose Cleaner - # 14522	ECO6114522	2.5GL	59.33	NO BID			D4501 concentrate	4gl/cs	44.04
Oasis Sanitizer - # 17708	ECO6100536	2.5GL	92.50	NO BID			Purell	bottles	28.04
Liquid Dish Detergent - # 11262	ECO6111262	4/1GL/CS	40.50	SNT417504	4GL/CS	14.58	D4666	4gl/cs	42.68
Rinse Additive - Solid Brilliance - # 25395	ECO6125395	2/2.5LB/CS	171.78	NO BID					
Scout Pot & Pan Cleaner - # 10906	ECO6110906	2/GL/CS	100.97	NO BID			D4672	4gl/cs	18.85
Wash N Walk Floor Cleaner - # 6100731	ECO6100731	2.5GL	92.39	NO BID					
MINIMUM ORDER TO AVOID SHIPPING FEES									

Note: Exact amounts used per year are unknown - meals are sent out 5 days a week, 52 weeks a year to numerous senior citizens from this Nutrition Site. We have a 120 bed jail and population varies.

TALLY# 2 - FOOD SERVICE SUPPLIES
July 1, 2019 - December 31, 2019
