
 

TALLY SHEET  
 

Bid Name: PRESCHOOL TRANSPORTATION – SUMMER 2018 

 

Bid Opening Date:  June 14, 2018 
 

 

VENDOR Durrin North Country Transport 

 w/Aide w/o Aide w/Aide w/o Aide 

ROUTE 1 

Saranac Lake to 

Adirondack ARC 

329.00 210.00 No Bid No Bid 

     

ROUTE 2 

Willsboro to  

Adirondack Helping Hands 

329.00 229.00 No Bid No Bid 

     

ROUTE 3 

Westport & Moriah to 

Children’s Development Group 

349.00 244.00 No Bid No Bid 

     

ROUTE 4 

Minerva to 

Children’s Development Group 

398.00 284.00 214.00 177.99 

     

ROUTE 5 

Willsboro to  

North Country Kids 

329.00 234.00 219.00 178.00 

     

ROUTE 6 

Willsboro to 

Children’s Development Group 

309.00 209.00 218.99 181.99 

     

     

 

 

 

SUBJECT TO FINAL APPROVAL 


