FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
Packaging Price | Packaging Price Packaging Price
(count Case OR (count er case OR (count er case
ltem# |percase OR ltem# |percase OR P ltem# | percase P
Each OR Each OR OR Each
each OR Pound each OR Pound OR each OR Pound
PRODUCT pound) pound) OR pound)
MEAT
1 |BACON ked-300ct| 6192011 | 2150CT | o004/
» Precooked - LD ¢ Case 18097 | 2/150ct 37.15
$30.72/
2 |BEEF LIVER, 40/4 oz 6603682 28/6 OZ Case 33051 40/4oz 24 80
CHICKEN BREAST, $41.99/
3 |BONELESS, random - 40¢ | 203474 | 410LB | "6 | 73075 | 4108 56.55
CHICKEN BREAST, $34.77/
4 |BONELESS, SKINLESS - 6628804 48/4 OZ c '
approx 4 oz ase 33159 | 4/10# - doz 91.20
CHICKEN BREAST $41.56/
% |CUTLETS - approx 4-6 0z | 2001469 | 481502 ase ST | duiTon 31.15
CHICKEN BREAST, 53.30/
6 STUFFED, 6-8 o0z, skin on 1412006 24102 Case NO BID
CHICKEN CORDON BLEU - $48.42/
! 4 0z 1624329 36/4 0 Case 87551 36/40z 48.00
$30.39/
8 |CHICKEN, DICED - 10# 6993851 1/10 LB Case 10246 oJ5i 3375
CHICKEN STRIPS FOR $37.66/
9 |[FAJITAS: seasoned, 1647353 2/5LB Calse
boneless, fully cooked - 10# 55103 2/5%# 39.35
10 CHICKEN THIGHS, BONE 53032 Fresh
IN SPO 4/10# 3.30#
CUBE STEAK, 4-5 0z no $44.44 |
" JacPac, no filers 8246712 | 404 0Z | "o o 33050 | 40/4oz 44.34
GROUND BEEF - 80/20 -
12 fresh - /58 566709 | AISHAV |8212Perlbl qu007 | 45 2454
GROUND BEEF - 80/20 - $58.53/
13 frozen - 4/5# 1222185 | 4RLB T e 14053 | 6M0# 2344
GROUND BEEF - 80/20 -
"% frozen - 81108 566838 | 4/10#AV [$201Perlb| 44055 | g0 2344
GROUND BEEF: 100%,
15190% lean, no fillers, frozen 566681 4/5#AV [$3.41 PerLb
or fresh - 10# 15837 2/5# 4.60#
16|GROUND TURKEY - 4/5# 7268279 4/51B §20.33/
) Case 52206 4/54# 34.50
HAM, REDUCED SODIUM, 2MM1#avg
17 2/10-15 Ib per cs - Not Deli 1708858 2/10-12# |$3.81 Per Lb 19152 Frzn LS 3.50#
HAM, SMOKED WHOLE,
18 2/14-19 b 8074461 | 111419 ($244Perlb  yg064 | 4/158avg 2 94
ITALIAN SAUSAGE LINKS, $31.57/
19 approx 4 oz - 10# 2434355 40/4 0Z Case 75592 48/40z 52.43
PORK BREAKFAST $30.83/
20|SAUSAGE LINKS, approx 1| 1589399 160/1 OZ c '
oz - 10# ase 10271 160/10z NO BID
PORK CHOP, BONELESS, $35.89/
21 approx 40/4 oz 1527761 404 0Z $Case 16940 40/40z 46.76
PORK CHOPS, approx 40/4 34.16 /
22| 2. center cut, 112" lean | 141970 | 4040Z T "o | 16938 | 40ioz 37.69
23 PORK LOINS, boneless,
lean unseasoned - 6/5-9% 15171 6/8.8#avg 2.25#

11/23/2020 dt




FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
SALISBURY STEAK, $53.40/ 84/40z -
24 approx 4 oz, JakPac 6525505 | 50132 0z Case 15839 21#cs 75.49
STEW BEEF lean USDA
25 choice. 3/4" cubes: NO iac- 6660813 | 2/5#AVG |$3.57 PerLb 14019 10# 5 48t
TOP ROUNDS, 4/8-12 Ib,
26 |USDA choice, trimmed, split| 1111913 2/8-11# |$2.75 Per Lb
and tied 12011 4/14#avg 3.99%
TURKEY BREAST, 2/8-
27|10lb, premium grade, not 7135759 2/8-10# |$3.78 Per Lb
deli, cooked, skinless 54036 2/10#avg 3.38#
FROZEN FOOD
BABY BACK RIBS -
" 1612258 322552 | 1I30KAVG [$3.64Perlb| 17414 | 4612 stavg 4264
BEEF PATTIES: 80% lean,
. .
” 100% beef, 3.patt|es/pound, 2388702 | 60/5.3307 $61.68/
round, paper in between Case
patties - 10# 11152 30/5.30z 36.99
BREAKFAST SAUSAGE $29.76 /
3 PATTIES - approx 1 0z 1589332 | 1601102 Case 10498 160/10z 28.95
BREAKFAST SAUSAGE $48.95/
4 |PATTIES, VEGETARIAN - | 4800451 |112/1.340Z CI
112/cs a3€ | 23048 SPO | 112/1.340z 32.50
$36.30/
5 |BREADED FISH COOKED | 7845625 1/10 LB Case 40156 80/3.602 43.00
BREADED FISH : $41.11/
6 uncooked, ready to bake, 1072082 | 42518 $Case 40161 SPO | 46/3.60z 26.00
BREADED FISH FILLETS - 28.93/
7 ADpIOX 4 07 5014661 1/10 LB $Case 10901 10# 33.70
CHICKEN BREAST, 41.99 /
8 |BONELESS, SKINLESs | /203474 | 4M0LB | Tooe | 33159 | 4110#- 4oz 82.00
CHICKEN BREASTS,
9 |approx 6.5 0z, bone in and 48ct -
skin on, no backs, no ribs, 53156 SPO | 25.47#cs NO BID
CHICKEN FILLETS, $38.06/
10 BREADED - approx 4 oz 8666051 404 0 $Case 55058 40/40z 33.30
CHICKEN LEGS - approx 6 42.29 |
11 oz, IQF 7917707 | 60/10.16Z Case 53220 60/9z NO BID
$20.59/
12|CHICKEN NUGGET 8412780 2/5LB Case 55054 295] 7102 19.95
$68.59 /
13|CHICKEN PATTY 5316627 4/BAGS Case 53210 o/ 21,92
14|CUBED PORK 1664994 2/5LB $24.671
Case 17079 2/5# 25.70
$22.82/
15|DANISH - assorted 2249365 5M10CT Case 51236 50/1.2502 92,99
$26.09/
16|DICED TURKEY 3054848 2/5LB Case 10161 o5 26.25
DINNER ROLLS -1 0z - $34.20/
17 proof & bake 1576875 8j24 CT Case 51196 150/1.250z 30.95
$35.11/
18| DONUT - assorted 3000965 |144/1.250Z Case 51119 196/1.30z 97 95
19 FISH NUGGETS - approx 1
0z 40157 4/5# 59.15
20 FRENCH FRIES sso7e7s | 65 | 226!
Case 34115 6/5# 19.70
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY

TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS

2 s o ATeT | 14415 02 $gl§ ' | srosespo | 1212 45.95
22 g 8D, il 125, 299517 | 201202 SERN e g e
23 22\2 i rOUN- eporer 17364 120122502 $§:5£/ 34210 | 2402250z 4398
24|HOT DOGS - All Beef 1137728 | 2/5LB $f33a§2/ 23080 8%:2; 2750
25|HOT DOGS (approx 80 cs) | 1073485 | 2/5LB $%;€;§2/ Y03 » 2500
5 FOT DOGS - LOW

SODIUM NO BID
27 HOT DOGS - TURKEY | 9822586 | 2518 | 1003/

Case | 23009 | 16012z 25,80
28 MANICOTTI - approx 3 0z 1042878 | 60/2.750Z $§;2§ / 35243 60/2.7502 3185
29| MEATBALLS 5063138 | 16011 OZ $ZCZ(S)S/ .y o 2360
30|MEATLOAF SLICES 33167 17 ér’fciii 55.32
31|OMELETS - approx 1 oz 9546797 | 200/1 OZ $32.22]

Case NOBID
32|OMELETS - approx 3 oz 7360704 | 72/3.50Z $g’§gl 26044 SPO | 84/307 NO BID
33| PANCAKES 1010255 | 144112507 $th;‘2’ sost | 144 208 23,65
34 EIS??EAQI\EIISLK approx 1.2 1783935 12161.2502 $?E:5£2 / 46001 144/1.30z 19.30
35| PEPPERONI: sliced 2368769 | 2/12.5LB $E§;g§’ 12067 » -
36 Bﬁ:&iug -10°- 9786021 | 20/8 0Z $ZC53§§’ 48006 20ct 2355
37 Egﬁﬁl,DC-Haiirsoi,:;z 9127358 | 48/60Z $i3322 e 60ct 49.98 5W52MN 60 | $47.00
B | 2255 2wz SR
% :ﬁgii gf NP se70 | 10145502 $2043§2/ 37807 | 10/430z 2500 2WPS | 10 | $30.00
0 GUsAGE 8131443 | 2518 $f;6a§§’ 10489 | st NO BID
“ Egi:CORN HCEN ] etz | 251 $zci§: e oI5 27.95
20 ot o shee | 715268 | 5802 | SR e eoss
43 E&Tf/r\yT)OES’ R smuone | esLe $Lé)2a§§ | s | 29.92
44 PULLED TURKEY 749717 | 1M0LB $3C‘9a§2/ 52031 5 ‘075
45 RAVIOLI 2467637 | 33LB $g§;/ sotz | am 25 15
46 STEAK UM 7161395 | 40/4 OZ $‘é‘;§; "1 wsiee | st 1750
47 SWEET POTATOFRIES | 5020197 | 6/25LB %SS/ win | o5 3045
48 EJDHEEEE;ZSHELLS ' 1948512 | 961207 $‘é°agg o I 4054
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
$46.18/
49/ TATOR TOT - approx 1 oz 1050954 6/5LB Case 34039 6/54 4175
TURKEY, WHOLE - raw,
50 frazen 1857309 | 2/20-24# |$1.26 Per Lb 50030 |2ct- 22/24# 1 648
TURKEY BREAST - raw,
51 frazen 4347126 2/8-10# |$3.25 PerLb 52036 21 1havg 3158
UNBREADED FISH $28.02/ 2/40z 10#
%2 FILLETS - approx 4 oz 450338 | 1M0LB | "o e | 10862 SPO | UPC#1002 2770
UNBREADED VEAL $40.39/
53 PATTY - approx 4 oz 2590222 110LB Case 16334 SPO | 40/40z NO BID
$55.68 /
54 VEGGIE BURGER, regular | 2023125 48/3.40Z Case 11100 SPO | 48/3 40z NO BID
VEGGIE BURGER, $51.91/
% outhwestern 9349960 | 4813402 | "o 0 | 11075SPO | 48/3.40z 52.99
$23.01/
56 \WAFFLES 1783901 | 144/1.587Z Case 46009 144/1 2302 1775
" $15.97/
57 |\WRAPS - 12 7657661 6/1 DZ Case 60048 6/12ct 1719
FISH
$71.39/ 24120z in
1 ITUNA FISH - 12 0z 7045083 | 24/120Z Case 43232 SPO | water 68.25
$41.49/ 6/66.50z in
2 ITUNAFISH - 66.5 oz 7519285 | 6/66.50Z Case 64025 water 44.00
EGGS
EGG PATTIES -1 0z - $32.22/
! frozen 9546797 | 20011 OZ Case 27062 144/10z 20.80
EGG PATTIES-1.50z - $33.09/
2 frozen 398439 | 16011.50Z Case 27049 120/1.50z 25.99
EGG PATTIES -1.750z - $33.09/
3 frozen 398439 | 16011.50Z Case 27092 144/1.750z 34.65
EGG PATTIES -2 0z - $26.47/
4 frozen 2738623 | 10020z Case 27093 100/20z 26.80
5 FRESH EGGS - LARGE -
15/doz 28006 15doz 24.46
6 FRESH EGGS - LARGE - Medium
30/doz 28028 30doz 40.80
7 PASTEURIZED EGGS -
15/2# 27048 15/2# 45.00
PEELED HARD COOKED - $46.71/
8 254 6764700 12518 Case 28108 254 47.99
PASTA & GRAINS
$20.95/
1 |BARLEY 4487633 241118 Case 78309 SPO | 24/1# 21.72
CASSEROLE ELBOW $21.97/
2 INOODLES 5204544 | 21M0LB | "o o 76884 | 21108 2115
$17.35/
3 |[EGG NOODLES 5204617 2/5LB Case 84082 11108 12.99
$21.41/
4 |ELBOW MACARONI 4862702 2/10 LB Case 84073 208 17.05
$15.06 /
5 |LASAGNA NOODLES 4933164 1/10 LB Case 76879 19/1# 15.80
. $16.93/
6 |RICE - par boil - 25# 4671350 1/25 LB Case 66014 o5 15.99
. $27.35/
7 |RICE - par boil - 50# 4323366 1/50 LB Case 66014 o5 15.99
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS

. $25.96 /

8 |ROTINI - tricolor 5204551 | 2/10LB o 76882 o104 2549
9 |ROTINI - plai 5004560 | 210LB | 2243/

- plain Case 84083 20# 18.55
o $21.317

10|SHELLS - Medium Size 5204585 2/10LB Case 76913 20 20.98
$21.407

11|SPAGHETTI 4862983 | 2110LB oo 84072 oot 1855
$24.17 ]

12/ZITI 4862835 | 2110LB oo 84074 o104 1855

BAKING PRODUCTS

1 | BAKING COCOA 5792684 | 6518 | 010199/

Case 92337 6/5# 94.02
$43.44 ]

2 |BAKING POWDER 7082172 | 6/5LB Oaco 68064 o5t 30,99
$17.76/

3 |BAKING SODA 7077490 | 24/1LB Caso 68058 o 19.02
$33.30/

4 \CANOLA OIL 3222686 | 4/1 GAL One 30088 6/1ga 1350
. $24.00/

5 |COCONUT: unsweetened | 4510921 | 5/2LB e NO BID
6 |CORN STARCH 4032001 | o4t | 179/

Case 91369 24/1# 18.45

7 |CRAISINS - 5# 73094 54 19.45
$24.04 /

8 |CRAISINS - 10# 6889125 | 1/10LB oo 73004 4 19.45
$16.35/

9 |FLOUR - 25¢# 8379270 | 2/25LB Coco 10820 o5 1575
$15.97/

10|FLOUR - 50# 4267274 | 1/50 LB Coce 10864 - 1615

11 PEANUT BUTTER CHIPS -

25# 75071SPO |  25# 83.89
SEMI-SWEET $52.26 /

12| CHOCOLATE CHIPS - 254 | 2500732 | 1/251B Case 92210 254 4855
$46.87/

13/SHORTENING 4684250 | 1/50 LB Coce 10954 - 26.30
$27.95/

14/SUGAR, BROWN - 24 5593702 | 12/2LB P 11183 1ot 2795
$43.48]

15/SUGAR, BROWN - 50# 1854926 | 1/50 LB Oaco 67009 - 28.50
SUGAR, $27.93 7

18] CONFECTIONERY - 2¢ 6593900 | 121218 Case 92205 1224 26.79
SUGAR, $43.23]

17 CONFECTIONERY -50¢ | 024918 | 1/501B Case 67007 504 38.85
SUGAR, GRANULATED - $33.98/

185y 2026727 | 10141B Case 68393 10/4# 30.99
SUGAR, GRANULATED - $35.64 /

19504 4762694 | 15018 Case 68395 504 34.65
$31.65/

20|VANILLA EXTRACT - 32 0z| 5239389 | 6/320Z Caco 68182 5/1602 1650
$31.65/

21|VANILLA EXTRACT - Gal | 5239389 | 6/320Z Caco 96205 agal 1374
$41.97/

22 VEGETABLE OIL - Gal 4119061 | 6/1 GAL Cace 20088 6/1a 35,30
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
28 WALNUTS dodsdod | 3i21B $§;8a;§/ 92353 halvj:/pcs 4166
INDIVIDUAL / BULK CEREALS
, [BRAN FLAKES - ncvidual-

1 oz 75488 SPO | 96110z 26.04
2l __B.u"(-ss orosate | 43507 *0 0" | amisp0 | aer 1430
I L T $2c2:2/ 84160 | 96Hoz 21.05
e EO ] aramss | a0z $1ng;/ 76254 | 4/350z 15.90
5 it o | Aoz SO g s
° (B:LTkN-Asl\g%S-T;AoSzTI_E_S_ aseds | w507 | 0 | ossaseo | s 2090
T op SR youea | sers 0z $?:i§2 ' |0 ogrter 21.94
8 ;:Zo -Rsl\zls ztAKES_BUlk-SZ 6709307 | 413502 $::‘;:2/ 76255 | 4/350z 14.25
T R L R T
| CREAV! OF WHEAT -

Individual - 1 0z NO BID
I EESELZD ?Lo/;KES- Aoatror | 961 0z $3&i§2 " sz | oeter 2755
12 g? gzs ' ESD onLAKES K emsteer | ansoz $::7a§§ ' lazsztspo| 4oz 13.99
13 g0 o R asonny | tauzoz $3§;§§ " e | st 1045
g o R gy | tauzoz $3&1§§/ 85522 | 121420z 3045
15 T/ZIZSIN PN qoagas | oeit 2502 $3&i§2/ 10519 SPO |  96/10z 2160
160y R erams | s 07 $1C7a:2/ 76243 | 4J3502 17.35
17y MMET ] aowseoo | seiis oz $3§;§2 " s | oster 36.15
18 M aoues | seisis oz $3§;§2/ 10634 | 9610z 24,50
O rssen ] awss | amsoz | PO s | s | tees
20 el o120, | 0199288 T0n202 ST e on g | asno
21> ngsz-DsiDonHEAT UK soasosr | ais oz $§:(;22 ' | resasro| 4mser 25,30
2 ol o | 29 w0z | SR e s
23 ;5? c?zT R IRUTES B | ronse | a0z $:37a§2/ 92336 SPO | 4/350z 17.45

DESSERT MIXES
Ui DT saTs | 6R00z $3CA;2§ " res | roteer 4250
2 |APPLE PIE FILLING - #10 | 6348015 |  6/#10 $‘é4a§§’ woes | 6o 4505
3 |BROWNIE MIX - 6/5# 1242439 | 6/5LB $i7a§;’ N 2740
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
4 \BROWNIE MIX, Sugar Free NO BID
5 |CAKE MIX, CARROT 28139 6/54 3765
6 CAKE MIX, CARROT,
Sugar Free NO BID
7 |CAKE MIX, CHOCOLATE 1242985 6/5LB §26.761
' Case 27955 6/5# 27.95
8 CAKE MIX, CHOCOLATE,
Sugar Free NO BID
9 |CAKE MIX, SPICE 28250 6/5 28.75
10|CAKE MIX, YELLOW 5301627 6/5LB §24.79
' Case 27973 6/5# 24.95
$24.81/
11|CAKE MIX, WHITE 5301601 6/5LB Case 28221 6/54 24.95
1 CAKE MIX, WHITE, Sugar
Free NO BID
$84.28 /
13|CHEESECAKE 1678481 6/4 LB Case 28216 6/44 50.15
14| GINGERBREAD MIX 08114 6/5 36.40
ICING, READY TO $56.00 /
15|SPREAD: MUST BE 4158929 2111 LB Cése
SHELF STABLE: Chocolate 45314 124 29.15
ICING, READY TO §51.69/
16|SPREAD: MUST BE 4046124 2/11 LB Cése
SHELF STABLE: Vanilla - 45315 12# 24.85
17 ICING, CHOCOLATE,
Sugar Free NO BID
18/ICING, WHITE, Sugar Free NO BID
MUFFIN MIX, BANANA $36.29/
19 NUT 1681519 2818 Case 28014 SPO 6/5# 52.05
$2255/
20|MUFFIN MIX, BASIC 1242425 6/5LB Case 28231 6/54 2505
$72.10/
21/MUFFIN MIX, BLUEBERRY| 4664504 6/78 OZ Case 28424 SPO 6/54 2595
$53.67/
22|MUFFIN MIX, BRAN 4044020 6/5LB Case 76608 SPO 6/54 55 95
$32.08/
23|MUFFIN MIX, CORN 2748905 6/5 LB Case 28217 6/54 3110
MUFFIN MIX, HONEY $53.67 /
24 BRAN 4044020 6/5LB Case 28225 SPO 6/5# 43.95
COOKING PRODUCTS
$35.44 /
1 |BEEF BASE 4944203 6/1LB Case 57719 12/1# 57 65
BEEF BASE, LOW $53.62/
2 |SODIUM S814421 | BB | "ooce 57716 | 1214 67.75
3 BEEF BROTH, LOW
SODIUM NO BID
$24.93/
4 |BISQUICK MIX 2810392 6/5LB Case 28237 6/5: 25 80
$11.47/
5 |BREAD CRUMBS, ITALIAN| 5249727 2/5LB Case 29131 6/5: 28 85
$27.90/
6 |CHICKEN BROTH 5568241 12/49 OZ Case 36580 12/480z 2790
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
CHICKEN BROTH, LOW $27.90]
iy ssee24t | 12490z | O OB
$36.89
8 |CHICKEN GRAVY 52600 | 81602 | P! oo 100z .00
CHICKEN GRAVY, LOW $42.11/ 81502
® |sopiuM 8877219 | 82267 | "o o 28448 | Poultry 29.25
$30.78
10| CHICKEN BASE - 1# somssa | ens | VDT U 5400
$142.717
11|CHICKEN BASE - 5# swazmo | asis | VT 57721 i 5.0
CHICKEN BASE, LOW $44.92]
12/ Sopium 6213359 | 6B | "o 57715 | 121# 59.35
$35.16
13/CRISPY ONIONS w671 | oe0z | P00 s | edor e
$25.93]
14 EALAFEL 8022207 | 2518 | P OB
INSTANT BROTH &
15 SEASONING - BEEF, LOW
SODIUM 91235 SPO | 300/4gm 36.60
INSTANT BROTH &
16/ SEASONING - CHICKEN,
LOW SODIUM 91236 SPO | 300/4gm 36.60
MINCED GARLIC, IN §33.90 /
7 quip 7127293 | 6120z | "o 68103 | 6350z 3429
$22.06]
18| PANCAKE MIX 2810432 | 6518 | o) 28035 5 23,00
$25.26
19| PORK GRAVY MIX 9820748 | 611302 | P2 700 | 8160 o
PORK GRAVY MIX, LOW $36.00/
20| opiuM 8877714 | 8M60Z | "o o 57709 | 8/160z 35.55
SOY SAUCE, LOW $39.00/
21l sopium 4897641 | 6L5CGAL | " 0 |37300SPO | 6/5al 38.97
STUFFING MIX. CHICKEN - $48.28
22|13 54 4396404 | 41356LB | oo 65040 | 6/550z 59.69
STUFFING MIX. $63.34)
23| S ORNBREAD - 6/3.5# 3747732 | 6IS60Z | "o oo | 65034SPO | 6/280z 33.75
SWEETENED $41637
24| CONDENSED MILK - 24/14| 3312096 | 2411402 1 " 0" 1 921795PO | 6/5gal NO BID
$44.93]
25 TEMPURA BATTER ag79027 | 6518 | V- 28130 o5 4590
THICK-IT INSTANT 4159
26 HEALTHCARE FOOD 101758 | 10076 |
THICKENER - PC a%€ | 76723 SPO | 100/6.5gm NO BID
THICK-IT INSTANT 5046/
27 HEALTHCARE FOOD 102194 | 1518 | P
THICKENER - Bulk : 76732 254 68.25
1652
28/ TOFU - 12/14 oz 9007433 | 121602 | O MO BDD
29| TOFU - 6/4# 0007433 | 127160z | °10-92/
- Case 88520 /4 33.85
§37.83]
30| TURKEY GRAVY MIX 5618 | 1607 | Vo 5608 | ait6os 39,00
TURKEY GRAVY MIX. $42.117 81502
311 ow sopium 8877219 | 82267 | "o o 28448 | Poultry 29.25
§20.18/
32| VEGETABLE BASE 562995 | 6B o | eeoo e 2375
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
33|VINEGAR 5868328 | 4/1 GAL |$7.48/Case 56100 41gal 6.99
WORCESTERSHIRE $28.61/
34 saucE 6003867 | 3MGAL | "0 ce 75181 | 4f1gal 27.99
35 WORCESTERSHIRE
SAUCE, LOW SODIUM
SALAD DRESSINGS
1 SALAD DRESSING Low
Fat French 56058 SPO | 4/1gal NO BID
SALAD DRESSING Low $35.88 /
2 Fat Ranch 4086575 4NGAL Case 78427 4/1gal 37.99
SALAD DRESSING Low $31.45/
3 Fat Golden ltalian 4488346 | 411 GAL Case 56025 4/1gal 29.45
4 SALAD DRESSING Low
Fat Thousand Island 56147 Spo | 4/1gal NO BID
5 SALAD DRESSING
Catalina 67266 SPO | 4/1gal 45.49
. $32.65/
6 |SALAD DRESSING ltalian 4003687 4/1 GAL Case 56176 41gal 3395
$33.54 /
7 |SALAD DRESSING Ranch | 4003679 4/1 GAL Case 56171 41gal 3435
SALAD DRESSING $34.75/ 4/1gal
8 Thousand Island 4069431 41 GAL Case 56060 GF 35.20
SALAD DRESSING $45.45/
; POWDER MIX, Italian 4847323 | 18171602 Case 28215 12/7.60z 33.26
SPICES
$62.31/
1 |BASIL LEAVES 8173397 3/22 OZ. Case 68009 3200z 36.50
2 |BASIL, CRUSHED 68017 SPO | 6/120z 24,00
3 |BLACK PEPPER 5229273 6/1LB $80.76/
Case 69355 SPO 6/1# 56.50
$41.69/
4 |CELERY SALT 5228465 6/30 0Z Case 68010 SPO | 6/360z 4210
$59.43/
5 |CHILI POWDER 9806498 6/20 0Z Case 67992 SPO 6/14 38.40
$43.15/
6 |CHIVES, DRIED - 1 0z 5913694 | 6/1.350Z Case 67991 SPO 6/10z 25 50
7 |CHIVES, DRIED - 6/#10 NO BID
$65.97 /
8 |CINNAMON 6639512 618 Z Case 68011 6/1# 44.00
$52.54
9 |CRUSHED RED PEPPER 9806423 6/13 0Z Case 67999 6/120z 3420
$67.95/
10|DILL WEED 5228770 6/50Z Case 68001 SPO 6/502 5115
$94.51/
11|GARLIC, GRANULATED 6639165 6/26 OZ Case 68002 6/2502 69.79
$76.09/
12|GARLIC POWDER 9806449 6/21 0Z Case 69343 SPO | 6/190z 51.90
$73.41/
13|GROUND GINGER 4827832 | 6/12.50Z Case 69260 SPO | 6/1602 5345
$70.96 /
14|LEMON PEPPER 9806480 6/28 OZ Case 69345 SPO | 6/2602 63.40
MONTREAL STEAK $64.65/
15 SEASONING 6639553 | 61292 | "rase 169350 SPO | 6l260z 54.90

11/23/2020 dt

9




FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
MRS. DASH SALT $2163)
18] SUBSTITUTE - ORIGINAL | 116052 30000.030Z) " " | 93047 5PO | 312102 48.00
$97.22]
17INUTMEG 5220067 | 6B | o 55012 i 50,96
$57.71)
18| ONIONS, dehydrated 5865498 | 6218 | ol espo e 2450
$44.68)
19/ONION POWDER 5220125 | G007 | Ceroo | saie oo 60or 2820
$71.02)
20| OREGANO 526430 | 518 | L s | o 4520
$54.14]
21|PAPRIKA 520174 | G18OZ | “orll | cainono | lieor 2420
$38.14)
22 PARSLEY FLAKES 522065 | 31007 | ol 5076 | 620 1265
$70.167
23 POULTRY SEASONING | 5220562 | 61202 | 010 57005 | 61208 54.00
$14.98)
24| TACO SEASONING 822611 | 518 | i 55683 o 54
SOUP
CHICKEN NOODLE LO-S0 $2011/
Y 7502 4104469 1 24772502 "o o 76569 | 24/7 2502 20.85
, |CHICKEN NOODLE L0-50
-50 0z 11892 SPO | 12/500z 44.45
5 ICREAN OF CELERY -75
oz NO BID
CREAM OF CELERY. $43.04]
4| CONDENSED - 50 oz 4040317 1 125002 1~ 76502 | 12/500z 43.60
- (CREAM OF CHICKEN - 7.5
oz 36699 | 24/7.250z 2450
- ICREAM OF CHICKEN, LO-
S0-750z NO BID
 |CREAM OF MUSHROOM -
750z 36670 | 24/7.2502 2450
CREAM OF MUSHROOM - $45.86
8150 0z 4040382 | 1215002 | "o 11899 | 12/500z 46.45
o (CREAM OF MUSHROOM
LO-80 - 7.25 0z 36671 SPO | 24/7 250z 20.24
0| CREAM OF MUSHROOM
LO-80 #5 11880 SPO | 12/49.50z 44.24
11]TOMATO - 7.5 0z 76590 | 24/7.250z 21.70
TOMATO, CONDENSED - $34.89)
12/50 oz 4040390 | 1255002 | "o 11890 | 12/500z 33.90
13]TOMATO LO-S0 - 7.25 0z 36994 SPO | 24/7.2502 19.65
S44.31) | 11090
14 TOMATOLO-SO- 500z | 4146445 | 1215002 | ° 0 Healthy
ase Request | 12/500z 31.85
5 VEGETABLE [0-50-7.25
0z 36997 SPO | 24/7.250z 25.45
FROZEN DESSERTS
ANGEL FOOD CAKE - $34.42]
! \Uniced - 6/20 oz 5357559 | BI200Z | "o oo 17922 | 6/8" Round 31.25
$32.15)
2 |APPLE PIE RAW 1972744 | oup0z | R . 145
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
3 |APPLE PIE BAKED 9787748 | 6/48 0Z $‘é‘;§2/ @ | e 4005
4 APPLE PIE SUGAR FREE | 6122085 | 6/10IN $g§2/ NOBID
5 |BERRY MEDLEY PIE st | o 2150
6 BLUEBERRYPIERAW | 1972728 | Moz | 2054/
Case | 48092 | 6/460z 45.40
7 gb%iiEsgng'E’ DET ' 6201345 | 6us 0z 350762;/ NOBID
8 |BOSTON CREAM PIE 1972000 | 6/330Z 3222/ 605 | 6350 10,95
9 |CARROT CAKE premade 234559 2[72 0Z $5CZa'Zg/ 48042 4/9602 7414
10/CHERRY PIE RAW 1972702 | 6146 0Z 3222/ 600 | 6i6or 270
1 CHERRY PIE, DIET
SUGAR FREE NO BID
g o | o270z ‘0 e | g | s
13|CREAM PIE: Chocolate 1074806 6/27 OZ $:ét;2/ 48089 610" 3445
14 SZEQM ik Cocond 9809204 | 6127 0Z $3§;§Z/ 48024 | 61270z 3445
g oo | et | o0z | SO g g | sass
16 oo sz | awwoz | O oy | e | e
17 gTii\?VEBAEl\IiRY - approx 4 3412394 484 0Z $1C5£2 / 71013 24/40z 7.60
18 L%Ergffﬁy VANILLA- 1 atqoa10 | 48140z $1CZ§§/ 2ot | oates 60
19 Crose ot 4o | 1819242 | 24407 59301 Case OB
20 E:FIIEO%%EL/X\'I/EEI\{Saﬁprox 40z 3581662 48/40Z $%:1aZ: / 71002 24/40z SF 7.60
2 iiin otz | 25609 oz | SCI T s 1
22 LEMON PIE 9788522 | 6/36 0Z $3Ci§§/ 6141 | 660z 3855
2 AR grgsata  es 02 $?éi:§ | s | e 48.65
24\WHIP TOPPING - 12/32 0z | 1060375 | 12132 0Z $g;§’ o000 | 123202 34,90
25 m&:PEg/I &Z?ﬁi 2389534 | 12116 0z $?(’:i§§ | o | e 39.99
JUICES / DRINK MIXES
1 |APPLE - 46 0z 6050140 | 12/46 0Z $%‘;§Z/ 50 | 124600 2630
2 |CRANBERRY - 46 0z 7032160 | 8/46 OZ $§£S/ 52 | 1260s 2014
3 |GRAPE JUICE - 46 0z 6050132 | 124602 $g§§/ 051 | 12i460s 3460
4 ORANGE - 64 0z 6050124 | 12146 OZ $§Z§§’ R 3339
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
$34.93)
5 PINEAPPLE - 46 oz 6050140 | 124607 | o) 05 | 12i460s .00
$22.25]
6 TOMATO - 46 oz 4081564 | 12460Z | oo 050 | 124600 2045
$2058)
7 APPLEEZO-55 oz 4164034 | 485507 | o U . 2053
$19.30/
8 ICRANBERRY EZ0-5502| 4036315 | 4815502 | o) | yoco o yocc ’t o4
$22.36)
9 |GRAPE EZO - 5.5 0z 416497 | 485507 | oD NG BDD
ORANGE JUICE EZ0 - 555 $2181)
10, 4164018 | 4815502 | " oo | 47049 SPO | 4815502 23.35
1| ORANGEIPINEAPPLE EZ0
5502 NO BID
12 PINEAPPLE EZO - 5.5 0z sos | 4am50n 2030
13 PRUNE EZO - 4 0857319 | ogi40z | 1354/
"hoz Case 47356 72l40z 18.50
14/ PRUNE EZO - 5.5 0z OB
15 TOMATO EZO - 5.5 533683 | 485550z | o703
T900Z : Case 47325 | 48/5.502 17.85
V-8EZOLOSO-55 0z $25.167
16 low sodium 5142187 | 485502 Case 47331 48/5.50z 25.50
NO SUGAR ADDED - $2056)
17 APPLE - 5.5 0z 4164034 1 4815502 1 "o NO BID
NO SUGAR ADDED - $22.36)
18 SRAPE - 5.5 0z 4164497 1 48155021 "o NO BID
o NO SUGAR ADDED -
ORANGE - 5.5 0z NO BID
NO SUGAR ADDED - $2531)
20| 5INEAPPLE - 5.5 oz 7776083 | 485502 "o o NO BID
GRAPE DRINK MIX - $27.61)
21 BOWDER - 21-24 0z 4138616 | 1212402 | "o 27509 | 12240z 2115
ORANGE DRINK MIX - $27.62]
22| 5 WDER - 21-24 0z 4138608 | 122402 | "o 27530 | 120240z 2115
LEMONADE DRINK MIX - $22.02)
23| b OWDER - 21-24 0z 6851562 | 12121602 " oo 27507 | 120240z 2115
1 PINKLEMONADE DRINK
MIX - POWDER - 21-24 0z 27532 | 12/240z 2145
ICE TEA DRINK MIX - $23.23]
25| B OWDER - 21 - 24 oz 9742602 | 12234 | "o o 27533 | 120240z 2145
BULK PRODUCTS
. [AUGRATIN POTATOES -
12/20.35 0z 34161 | 12120.350z 58.65
BAKED BEANS (Gramma $26.54 /
2 Brown) - #10 5112107 | 6/#10 Case 66045 | 60 43.45
$91.08/
3 |BEEF STEW - 10# 4067039 | 6/410 0 seoeaspo | 0 OB
$33.37)
4 |BEETS, SLICED - #10 4015343 | 6/410 o o0 | 60 2555
$3046
5 BEETS, DICED - #10 4109310 | 6/#10 o o057 | 6o 2035
$52.13)
6 |BLACK OLIVES - #10 3500999 | 6/#10 o stz | 6o 1095
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
T ooount s e w0z | SERN e yieany ass
B lone g st | anol | SO o | g 28.55
O oauce 810 waorzs | om0 | SO | amo 36.90
10|CHILI SAUCE - #10 4003886 | 6/#10 %:Z/ st | emno 2090
11|COFFEE - 1416 0z 6957799 | 18114 0Z $18;feﬁ/ 105 | 241408 25 00
120 O PR sy | o0z $1§:§3e5 | o | saer 53.75
Braeg | eesTee | 181402 $1§;§3e6/ 71105 | 24/14oz 125,00
or o eestoas | 4 02 $:30a5s:\ " | osssspo| w120z | NoBD
S oak aser o sz | 96207 | ST 60| gunsen 87.50
T DR 4002499 | 41 GAL $3C7a;12 " seom0 41gal 38.70
By | AOTST | Go $eéﬁa§§ " e | emo 32,50
19 SéigﬁN#ﬁg EASETE wosmyr | ano $205322 " e | 6o 2445
20| GRAPE JELLY - #10 4184461 | 610 $507a;§’ oss | et3es 1240
21/GRAPEJELLY - 13202 | 4184453 | 6/4LB $3c1522/ oss | et3es 1240
22 GREEN BEANS - #10 4062394 | 610 $20122’ sos | 60 2020
23| GREEN BEANS, 1416 0z 45244 Frzn | 12124 23.00
24 GREEN PEPPERS - #10 N 05
25 g | swetss | wteal | PO g 2315
26| JALAPENOS - #10 5882758 | 6410 $3C3a§; " s | e _
27 KETCHUP - #10 5686266 |  6/4#10 $§)4a:2/ st | 6o e
28 KETCHUP, 12- 14 oz bottle| 4560934 | 36/14 0Z $?é4a§; o IR 2570
29 KIDNEY BEANS - #10 4014973 | 610 $204a§; o R R 2000
30 KIDNEY BEANS, 14 - 16 0z N0 BD
3 ;mSHED TOIOEST serime | ot $f:1é§:/ 35016 | 6/5.754 54,55
2 o R vy o | SO s anga 2275
B ] 413 | 4 GAL $§:5a§:/ 56024 | 4/1gal 27,69
34|MUSHROOMS - #10 5072137 | 6/#10 $f37a§:/ st | 60 570
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
35|MUSTARD - 12 oz bottle | 4736070 | 12/12 0Z $g§2/ s1027 | 121208 850
36| MUSTARD - Gal 4006797 | 411 GAL $§a:2/ w8 | 4igal a5
37|NORTHERN BEAN - 10# | 4062360 |  6/#10 %2‘2:/ osas | 6o 2755
38|PEANUTBUTTER -5% | 4009189 | 6/5LB $?:i§2/ sy | e to1s
Wiy | 48T | ao $‘(1:1é§§/ 60095 | 6/#10 30,55
40| PICKLES, DILL - gal 7469893 | 411 GAL $f35a§;/ O 250
41|PICKLES, DILL - 5 gal 7158815 | 1/5 GAL %gg’ 60125 | 15l %670
42 PINTO BEANS - #10 3362274 | 6I#10 %SS/ 607550 | 610 219
43 %ZA AR Brate R | stozee0 | oo $3c43;2 " sst | amo 26.98
44|POTATOES, DICED - 10# | 4108866 |  6/#10 $209322’ s | emo 2700
4 poesagpnoxeo. | 78 21088 | TR T s | s | nos
45 POTATO PEARL Vitamin C

Enriched - 5# 35016 6/5.75# 54.55
Toonger 0| s | sezsls | TR e o s
48 PUMPKIN - #10 4111498 | 610 $‘é4aggl w0 | 60 4050
49| RAISINS - 304 3386712 | 1/30LB $‘fa§;’ " o 07
50|RAVIOLI - #10 4364568 | 6410 $3c3a;§/ soss | emno 2500
51/RED PEPPERS - #10 s | o 500
52| REFRIED BEANS - #10 | 5882311 |  6/#10 $3c1532/ w265 | 61150 1375
5 REFRIED BEANS - 1120z

1150z 62013 6/1120z 38.55
54 i GETARIAN. $10 5882311 | 60 $3C152§/ 92603 | 6/11502 33.75
55/ SALSA - #10 0953068 | 6/# 10 $3ng§’ st | 6o 65
56 SAUERKRAUT - #10 489171 | 610 %53’ o2 | 6o 20,40
57 SPAGHETTI SAUCE -#10 | 4189361 | 6/#10 %Zﬁ’ s | 6o 25 65
58 2;@?UHME T_T;1SOAUCE’ FON 0as053 | 610 $?;7a§: / 57021 61410 25.55
59 iT_i\qvoED TOMATO.Ga%8 | sagsory | 10 $gg§ / 56970 | 610 26.45
50/ STEWED TOMATO, LOW

SODIUM Grade A - #10 NO BID
6! PRESERVES. 41 sz | 048 | SO ol | g | e
<, STRAWBERRY TOPPING -

54 75105 | 6f45 50,60
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
SWEET POTATOES, syrup $35.46
63] 5rade A - #10 4114625 | 6/#10 Case 92369 6/£10 34.77
$28.027
64| TEA BAGS, Regular 4202214 fo100CT| V02 st | 10100 2787
TOMATOES, CRUSHED - $25.02
65410 4185030 | B0 o 57016 | 60 24,65
TOMATO PASTE, Grade A 1 $40.31
661410 4030664 | B0 oo 59085 | G0 36.00
7 TOVATO PASTE, LOW
SODIUM Grade A - #10 NO BID
TOMATO SAUCE, Grade A $24.99
68 w10 4978884 | B0 oo 57055 | 60 24,60
o TOVATO SAUCE, LOW
SODIUM Grade A - #10 57021 61410 25,55
70| WAX BEANS - 14 - 16 0z 45338 Frzn | 12/2# 28.50
71| WAX BEANS - #10 62022 61410 28.70
72 VEGETARIAN BEAN-#10 | 4110177 | oo | 2902/
- Case 60097 61410 24.80
$34.17] | 109744
73|3-BEAN SALAD - #10 4000782 | 6/#10 e o 5410 109
$34.70/
74/ 4-BEAN SALAD - #10 4097598 | 6/#10 . (074 5410 109
INDIVIDUAL SERVING [TEMS
1/CHIPS-C 6743437 | o420z | 21351
-wom Case | 77540 SPO | 104/10z 34.60
DORITOS - Cool Ranch - 1 $34.16 /
. 551910 | 104102 | " " | 77546 SPO | 104/10z 34.60
DORITOS - Nacho Cheese - $34.16/
31 oz 5611928 1041102 | " oo 77545 | 104M0z 34.60
4 |FUNYUNS CHIPS - .75 oz rags | 10417500 3460
HOT CHOCOLATE, $37.69/
5 |SUGAR FREE PACKET | 200775 | 6R4CT 1 "o 0 | 48200SPO | 6r40ct 36.75
$20.25]
6 |ORANGE JUICE - 4 oz 956809 | 964 0Z | Voo 00 | 72i0s 1290
POTATO CHIP - regular - 1 $34.16/
7oz 5511175 | 104102 | 7 77542 | 104/10z 34.60
POTATO CHIP - BBQ - 1 $34.16/
8z 5511134 | 104102 |~ o 77541 | 104/10z 34.60
POTATO CHIP - Sour $34.16/
9 Cream & Onion - 1 0z 5511183 | 1041107 Case 77543 104/10z 34.60
$28.90/
10|PRETZELS - 1 oz 8083164 | 88107 | oo O R 2045
78574
11|TORTILLA CHIPS - 2 0z Scoops | 72187502 290
$23.28]
12/PC APPLESAUCE 2603005 | 72407 | SO 64153 | 06450z 26.90
13|PC BBQ SAUCE 3713567 | 10010Z ($940/Case| coors | 100/10n 04
$20.37
14|PC BUTTER cups - 8 Ib 5419353 | 18l | Vo 2313 | 72005gm 2445
5 PC CEREAL - GLUTEN
FREE CHEX 84166 | 96/10z 22.90
16|PC COFFEE 7081201 |19211.250z| S104:48/
: Case 71220 | 8411.750z 46.22
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
17|PC COFFEE, DECAF 5259346 | 5/100 CT $g§2/ 21017 | 8417500 o
18/PC CREAM CHEESE 4507432 | 1001 OZ $235£3/ 25001 | 1001102 730
19 ggchIET CRANBERRY 1 qa7g136 | 20005 02 $§:261:Z / 64053 SPO | 200/502 25,93
20|PC HALF & HALF 8116055 | 360/3/8 OZ $235a§2/ 67174 | 360 - 3580 310
21|PC JELLY - diet 6937445 | 2003/8 OZ $2;43::/ o622 | 200/12gm 475
22|PC JELLY - regular 5258835 | 400/10 GM $%06;;2 / 91197 20015 0z 1279
B Conzortumsomns | 99500 00860 SE | s | ioooegn | 1rss
24 EfieM APLE SYRUP SUT 1 soma80 100111 02 $1:532§/ 35057 | 100/1.1 oz 15.25
25|PC MARGARINE cups 4546049 | 900/5 GM $ch:§/ s2112 | so0isgm 21 50
26|PC MAYONAISE 4219218 | 500/12 GM $3gag; "1 s | soos - 655
27|PC MUSTARD 1608850 1000/5.5 GM $1C7352/ 56223 | 500/.5gm a
28/PC PANCAKE SYRUP 3911504 | 20011.50Z $Zc8a§2/ 66229 | 1001500 055
29 zquf\EriﬁKE SR seaa80 | 00711 02 $1c532§/ 35057 | 100/1.1 oz 15.25
30 PC PEANUT BUTTER 4046355 | 2001.75 0Z $%9322/ 66527 | 200/ 50r 7215
5 s o 50n 5527 1048252 S00T | s ruse | wom
32|PC RELISH 4667093 | 500/9 GM $20332§/ o219 | 2008gm 1050
33 PC SALT SUBSTITUTE | 1116052 |300/0.030Z $ZC1£§/ NOBID
34|PC SPLENDA 5817251 | 2000/1 GM $zc4a§e5/ sr002 | 2000 25 35
35 PC SUGAR 4000899 2000111007 $103a;12/ sr001 | 2000 1249
36 PC SOURCREAM cups | 5031836 | 10011 OZ $g§§/ osais | 10010z 1430
37 PC SWEET & SOUR 3132065 | 20011 0Z $1C‘9a§; " s | 100tes 034

FRUITS & VEGETABLES,
1 |APPLES, fresh 1408061 | 11257 | 180/

: Case | 88025 | 40#120ct 39.99

APPLES! SIiced, Juice or $4573/
2 vﬁvs{t\er packed, Grade A - 1467968 6/#10 Case 10251 6410 4099
3 Glr:\’:vbeE::rL\Jecc:il,EGradeA- 7302151 | 6RHO $€:1£:/ 65045 | 6/#10 23.15
4 |APRICOTS - Grade A-#10| 29078 |  6/#10 $g§;/ e | e 3616
5 |BANANAS, fresh-150¢t | 1007384 | 1/150 CT $§:Z§S/ 8036 | 1500t 2075
; [FROZEN BERRY MEDLEY

204 45264 | 25t 2150
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
$14.79/
7 |CABBAGE, fresh 1007970 1/50 LB Case 88091 50 16.25
$14.59/
8 |CANTELOPE, fresh 1164375 116 CT Case 88039 12-15¢t 28,65
$26.79/
9 |CELERY. Bunch 1120625 1124 CT Case 88308 1ct 161
COLE SLAW MIX - 4/5# $19.01/
10 pags 1675701 | 45LB | "o | 88130 | 4t 20.00
CRANBERRY SAUCE $49.20/
" \Whole, Grade A - #10 5729983 | 6M10 "o |64049SPO | 6010z 46.15
CRANBERRY SAUCE, $37.65/
12| Jellied, Grade A - #10 4608907 | BMO1OZ | "o o0 | 47037 | 6M0toz M71
CUCUMBERS, fresh - 24-
13 30 case 2036507 1M0LB |$9.39/ Case 88110 154 14.99
CRUSHED PINEAPPLE: $27.88
14|fancy, juice Hawaiian 8921201 6/% 10 Ce;se
Coarse, Grade A - #10 64045 6/#10 32.50
FROZEN
15|STRAWBERRIES, 5341836 2/5LB $2C(22:/
UNSWEETENED - Grade A 45177 10# 18.95
FROZEN
16| STRAWBERRIES, 1024439 1/30 LB $:2;53'2§/
UNSWEETENED - Grade A 45177 104 18.95
FROZEN
17|STRAWBERRIES, 2220806 6/6.5LB $EC3):ZSZI
SWEETENED - Grade A - 45175 6/6.5# 57.19
FRUIT COCKTAIL, Grade A $27.88/
18410 8676284 | GMI0 | "oose | 61041 | 60 2961
FRUIT CUPS, 4 oz - Grade $19.03/
19 4714663 | 36MOZ | Tooce | 46233 | 36l4oz 19.49
FRUIT MEDLEY,
20|Festival/Classic, melon 7468141 2/5LB $?é?;2;/
pieces, grapes - Grade A - 31226 1/8# 22.85
$10.14 /
21|GREEN PEPPERS, fresh 6902340 1/5LB Case 88168 20 4050
$21.86 /
22|HONEYDEW MELON, fresh| 1000538 1/6 CT Case 88048 5.6ct 2069
LETTUCE, Iceberg, fresh, $49.51/
23 head 1492628 V24T Case 88124 24ct 4550
o4 LETTUCE, Iceberg, fresh,
bag 88131 4/5# 29.99
MANDARIN ORANGE, $50.20 /
25 sections, light, Grade A - 3548393 6/#10 Case 66031 6/#10 28.40
26 ONIONS, fresh 5430202 | 110LB $7.95/Case| go,cs - 25 95
$49.90/
27 |ORANGES, fresh 7651926 1113 CT Case 88348 113t 3405
PEACHES diced, light $26.80 /
28 Grade A -#10 680688 6#10 Case 64008 6/#10 28.90
PEACHES vyellow, light $48.12 /
29 cling halves, Grade A - #10 3552643 6/#10 $Case 64008 Diced | 6/#10 28.90
PEACHES sliced, light 26.80 /
30/ Grade A - #10 4218996 | 610 | Tooce | 63043 | 60 28.69
PEARS halves, light Grade $48.12/
3110 3652643 | 610 | "ooce | 64019 | 610 NO BID
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
2y O | aaTsass | o0 $f;i§§’ 64012 | 6410 3245
Boman i | oo a0 | SO e | e
3 E;T;E;PZLrsdzlfed#i o | 4106480 | 610 $A(r31ei:g/ 63037 | 6410 35.80
35| PLUMS, fresh 88071 SPO |  25# NO BID
36| POTATOES, fresh 1008515 | 1/50 LB %22/ 53600 o 25,90
37/SNOW PEAS 1008382 | 1M0LB 322622/ 80565 570 | 6o OB
ST o s
39 TOMATOES, fresh 1763440 | 12518 3‘(‘:3623/ soe | o5 o4
0 e Gso Ao | 70075 00| SO e 26.40
41| WATERMELON, fresh 365203 | 11CT 8932/ Case| ggos » 5 06

VEGETABLES - FROZEN

I |ASPARAGUS, Grade A | 5124852 | 62518 | 2 82!

’ Case | 45086 | 6/2.5% 28.30
2 gg?ﬁ%ﬁ?ggi A 3644036 | 6iLB $ggg/ 34395 | 65t 42,69
3 |BROCCOLI, CUT, Grade A | 3831153 | 1/30LB $3(’:1£2/ w5131 o0 465
4 zﬁgio“ SRS 7288119 | 12218 $2c1é:2/ 45229 | 12028 2279
S g?aLcjiiSAEL SPRONTS 7288091 | 12218 $2c2§:/ 45255 | 1204 25.99
6 omdon 147494 | 127218 $2c1:§ s 204 1850
7 |CAPRI MIX, Grade A 1526769 | 121218 $2c?;2;/ wae | oo 2250
8 gfchii /C\ARROTS’ "] tosesos | 12218 $2ci§2/ 45228 | 208 20,45
9 (CARROTS, CUT, Grade A | 3960341 | 1/30LB $2C1£2/ wos | oo 570
0 raien | 360388 | 113018 $%:2£Z/ 45100 | 12024 19.45
11/CAULIFLOWER, grade A | 3772514 | 1212LB $ggg o I 250
12/CORN, Grade A 3533494 | 1/30LB $f§;:2/ wan | oo 075
B men | 308 | 15018 $§:2§2/ 45265 | 208 245
14 SEE,EgraBdEeAE ST st 2 $€:3£2/ 4533 | 1204 23.35
1 gﬁ(ljsen o PR qareosy | 12218 $%:2§2 | e | o 25,85
16|/FAJITA STRIPS 1647353 | 2/5LB %SS/ w01 | 1o OB
17 E;Fr{aiNeiH CREENBEANS. | aaeeaos | 12t $§:i:§/ 45253 | 1204 28,55
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
Baen 571240 | 124 B $Aé5agz | s | o 37.75
19/ITALIAN MIX, Grade A 1474998 | 12/2LB $f:222/ 45348 204 93.99
D mten | 1T | eLs $?:i§; " ae | o 25.74
21|LIMA BEANS, Grade A 1440270 | 122518 $‘é3agg/ 45312 o0k 29 54
22 g:;(cljseDA\,/iC\:vz\r/ArEil;(Es 1263623 | 122518 $§1§3 " s | o 25,59
23|ONIONS, DICED, Grade A | 6191712 | 6/2LB $233a§:/ 45102 12/o# 25,95
2 gRIENTAL BLEND, Grade | ,oo000 | e 1 $%6azz/ oo » .
25 PEARL ONIONS. Grade A | 1719517 | 4/2LB $231£Z/ 153505P0 | 12108 33.90
26 PEAS, Grade A 3533528 | 1/30LB $3c1é§:/ 45136 o0k 2195
27|PEAS/CARROTS, Grade A | 3959277 | 1/30LB $2§;/ 45137 204 2015
I I B [l (PO P e
29/SCAND BLEND, Grade A | 1474980 | 12/2LB $ZC63§; / 45124 o0k 9195
20 iPINACH, chopped Grade |, 0onas | 191018 $?E;Za.§;1/ . o5 3050
31/SWEET PEAS, Grade A | 3533528 | 1/30LB $%1£2 / 45136 204 21,95
32| TURNIPS, Grade A 45327 |1/20# Diced 19,55
23 XVAX BEANS, CUT, Grade | ooxooc | 1m0 15 $2ng§/ . o OB
34|WINTER BLEND, Grade A | 3890969 | 1/30LB $20z;2/ 45000 12/0# 24.40
35|ZUCCHINI. Grade A 45294 20# NO BID

PUDDING
1| BUTTERSCOTCH - 6/10# | 4011011 | 6/#10 $3§;§2/ 73193 6/#10 29.20
2 |CHOCOLATE - 6/10# 5106554 | 12/2LB $g§:/ 73191 6110 29.20
3 EA'I"XO_ﬂOZ/L;TE POWDER | 5106554 | 127218 $g§:/ NO BID
4 ;TXO_ﬂOQ/LQTEZPOWDER 4780557 | 12/280Z $%22§/ 28585 | 121240z 25.50
5 |LEMON - 6/10# 4011052 | 6/#10 $g§2/ 73195 6/#10 30.99
6 |PISTACHIO - 6/10# NO BID
7 |TAPIOCA - 6/10# 4011102 | 6/#10 $g§2/ 73196 6/#10 31.71
8 |VANILLA - 12/24 oz 4011078 | 6/#10 $%(;;Z/ 28477 | 121240z 27.99
9 YSELLLA POWDERMIX- 1 4010922 | 12124 07 $%1£2 / NO BID
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
o/ SUGAR FREE -
BUTTERSCOTCH - 5 oz 28474 SPO | 12050z 27.18
SUGAR FREE - $14.90/
" CHOCOLATE - 5 0z 664369 | 48/3.250Z| " " | 28473SPO | 1213502 21.84
SUGAR FREE - VANILLA - $14.92/
125 o 664452 | 48/3.250Z| " | 28463 SPO | 1213502 19.71
3/ SNACK PACK PUDDINGS;
BUTTERSCOTCH -3.5 oz 73187 | 483502 16.95
SNACK PACK PUDDINGS, $19.12/
14 CHOCOLATE - 35 oz 5661582 | 48/3.50Z st 73188 | 48/3.50z 16.95
SNACK PACK PUDDINGS, 19.127
16/ g o 5763834 | 483507 | Vo ° 3186 | 48500 695
| SNACK PACK PUDDINGS;
DIABETIC. RICE - 4 oz 73180 SPO | 48/doz 27.77
SNACK PACK PUDDINGS, $24.08/
17 DIABETIC. TAPIOCA -4 07| 042362 | 484 0Z (Sase 73209 SPO |  48/4oz 2477
SNACK PACK PUDDINGS, 24.08]
"8 DIABETIC. VANILLA - 4 oz | 2019900 | 4840Z | " 88862 | 48/3.250z 16.50
JELLO
1 IREGULAR - 24 t | 4010310 | 12240z | 3201/
"4 0z-ass Case | 29212 SPO | 121240z 31.40
 |SUGAR FREE RED - 275
oz 28272 SPO | 18/2.7502 38.00
 |SUGAR FREE CITRUS -
2750z 28273 SPO | 18/2.750z 38.00
DAIRY
CHEESE AMER 13/
1 PROCESSEDSLICED- | 6697114 | 4518 | *o
Yellow - 20Ib ase 25039 4/5# 59.87
CHEESE AMER ——
2 PROCESSEDSLICED- | 6697882 | 415LB | ° oo
White - 20Ib ase 25038 4/54 65.63
CHEESE, CHEDDAR -
3o 7018171 | 1110HAVG |S337 Perlb| oo, o o0
CHEESE, EXTRA SHARP -
4 Block - 10lb 2822312 | 110#AVG |33.39 Per Lb| opnas nys | 108 3.10#
CHEESE, MEXICAN - $66.80/
% | Shredded - 201b 7018109 | 4LB | "o o 25045 4/5# 78.63
CHEESE, MOZZARELLA - $54.66/
6 | Shredded - 201b 7018105 | 45LB | "o o 25155 4154 76.81
CHEESE, MOZZARELLA - $103.69 7
" | Shredded - 30Ib 2336865 |  6/5LB Case 25155 4154 76.81
5 ICHEESE, SHARP -
Shredded - 20 Ib 25042 4154 76.47
o (CHEESE, SHARP, LOW
SODIUM - Shredded - 20 Ib NO BID
0| CHEESE, SWISS - Block -
8b 25866 2/8# 3514
CHEESE, SWISS, LOW
] oo 1527183 | 1/148AVG |$4.16 Per Lb OB
$2153/
12|/ CREAM CHEESE - 3# 5020896 | 2518 | Vo soto | 105 55,73
$20.56 /
13COTTAGE CHEESE -5lb | 5020169 | 2518 | ‘oo 25117 u5i 2044
COTTAGE CHEESE, 1% - $18.97]
1451 8635740 | 4BLB | o o 25019 | 10/3# 55.73
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY

TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
$28.43/
15|LIQUID BUTTER -gal 3355757 3/1 GAL Case 58470 3/1gal 30,64
$27.59/
16| MARGARINE - 30/11b 5164175 30/1 LB Case 29088 30/1# 2936
$52.77 1
17|PARMESAN CHEESE 6370571 4/51B Case 25330 4/54 59 53
PIZZA CRUST, rectangular $34.71/
18 par baked 2072923 | WGNMTOZ | "o o0 | 37807 | 10M30z 2700 2WPS | 10 | $30.00
$23.95/
19|SOUR CREAM - 5lb 1203207 4/5L.B Case 25328 4/5 25 26
26086
$14.02/ Strawb,
20 ' YOGURT - assorted 8221958 24/4 OZ Case 26088
Stra/bana,
26087 Vanilla| 48/40z 15.90
YOGURT, LIGHT - assorted $18.24 /
21 flavors 7849706 484 0 Case 26078 48/40z 17.90
YOGURT, VANILLA-21b - $24.94 /
2251 6472502 | GM4LB | rase 76516 | 6/320z 13.97
YOGURT, VANILLA-4-6
23 oz 9903576 | 12/5.3 0Z [$9.29/ Case 26154 SPO 12/60z 9.20
COOKIES & CRACKERS
COOKIES, CHOCOLATE $67.40/
1 |CHIP, frozen ready to bake | 1412642 |240/1.330Z C '
dough - 10z- 1.5 0z ase 39976 | 320110z 41.90
9 COOKIES, OATMEAL,
frozen ready to bake dough - NO BID
COOKIES, OATMEAL $67.46 /
3 |RAISIN, frozen ready to 1412667 |240/1.330Z Cl
bake dough - 1 0z - 1.5 0z ase 51466 | 213/1.50z 4557
COOKIES, PEANUT $52.17
4 |BUTTER, frozen ready to 7220346 | 21311.50Z C.
bake dough - 1 0z - 1.5 0z a€ 111453 SPO | 324/10z NO BID
COOKIES, SUGAR, frozen $37.10/
5 ready to bake dough - 1 0z - 7040512 | 3201 OZ Case 39988 32010z 40.18
COOKIES, WHITE CHIP $81.81/
6 IMACADAMIAN NUT, frozen| 4689510 |240/1.330Z c '
ready to bake dough - 1 0z - a%€ | 51504 SPO | 213/1.502 56.46
$42.93/
7 [FIGNEWTONS 4221461 120/2 PK Case 72051 120/202 46.98
FIG NEWTONS, individual $39.94 /
8 package 4220554 | 1201 Oz Case 72024 SPO | 120/10z 39.20
GRAHAM CRACKERS, $24.33 /
9 individual package 5278718 | 200/2PK Case 28125 200/2ct 23.25
LORNA DOONE COOKIE, $34.48 /
10 individual package 4125852 12011 0Z Case 72022 120/4ct 10z 32.09
SALTINE - KRISPY, $16.21/
" individual package 4204996 | 50072 CT $Case 73314 500/2ct 14 45
SALTINES UNSALTED 15.67 /
12/70PS, individual package |+ 14914 | 300ZPK T "o | 73312 | s00fct 29.95
13 SUGAR FREE COOKIE,
Chocolate, individual 32509 106/.750z 30.45
14 SUGAR FREE COOKIE,
Lemon, individual package 32510 106/.750z 30.49
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
SUGAR FREE COOKIE, $47.79]
15 Short Bread, individual 3204980 | 1208 CT Case 83086 SPO | 120/10z 47.60
MISC
$105.49/
1 |COFFEE, REGULAR-20z| 4116158 | 962202 | * > 11021 841207 53.75
$81.65/
2 |COFFEE, DECAF - 2 0z 5032142 | 961207 | .0 11216 841207 6729
BLACK PEPPER SHAKER - $44.80
3 | disposable 4941555 | 481502 " 67190 | 48/150z 42.76
BREAD STICKS - WHOLE $28.83/ 160/1.80z
4 \WHEAT 4898226 | 144M50Z1 " 0 |51087SPO| WG NO BID
5 | GARLIC BREAD -
BUTTERTOP 51399 | 12/100z 21.60
GLUTEN FREE - BAGELS, $26.82]
6 asst 1249727 | 2435021 " 51171 | 24/3.50z 26.98
7 | GLUTEN FREE - BREAD - 6240z
6/30 oz 10539 MultiGrain 45.87
| GLUTEN FREE - BREAD -
12/14 0z 10377 | 12140z 57.32
GLUTEN FREE - FROZEN 93577,
9 | SHERBERT, asst 93578,
, 8ss 93580  |96/40z SPO 33.95
GLUTEN FREE - $42.19]
10\ UEFINS, asst 798411 | 3630Z | e 51170 Blueb| 36/30z 42.89
$32.87/
11| HAMBURGER ROLL 124636 | 10112CT | 7 10385 | 6/8ct 4.5 2115
$33.22/
12/HOT DOG ROLL 2496451 | 12/12CT | V<2 37615 8/12ct NO BID
13|KOSHER - BREAD 2492199 | 10/36 OZ $3ct§2/
14 KOSHER - CHOW MEIN
DINNER
KOSHER - CHICKEN $36.03/
15 SNNER 5572980 | 6113502 | o)
15| KOSHER - CHICKEN LEG
DINNER
17\KOSHER - COLD CUTS
18|KOSHER - FISH DINNER
1o KOSHER - POT ROAST
DINNER
20 KOSHER - SALISBURY
STEAK DINNER
KOSHER - SLICED $56.91/
21| o eESE 6697882 | 4/5LB oo
KOSHER - SPAGHETTI & $35.88
22|\ IEATBALL DINNER 5674410 | 6M30Z | "o
KOSHER - TURKEY $35.90
23| NNER 5735756 | 6/120Z | o
READY MADE BISCUITS - $30.40/
2450 5622873 12022502 " 36832 | 100/20z 26.68
READY MADE BISCUITS - $30.40/
25 5622873 12022502 " o 36843 105/2" 20.95
SALT SHAKER - $13.35/
2 disposable 4941548 48/4 OZ Case 67189 48/40z 12.40
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY
TALLY - DECEMBER 1, 2020 - FEBRUARY 28, 2021

VENDOR NAME SYSCO RENZI NARDONE BROS
$17.23]
27|SPRAY COATING (pan) 4135380 | 61702 | T 66424 5/1702 1797
$20.91/
28 TORTILLA CHIPS 2272690 | 6/2LB oo 60054 3ot 1055
$15.97/
29 ITORTILLA SHELLS 7657661 | 6/1DZ O 60052 | 200/5.25" 1254
MILK
1 |WHOLE MILK - gal 7132587 | 41280z | 1789/
Case
2 |WHOLE MILK - 112 gal 2557460 | 6/5GAL $1C‘;§’Z/
3 \WHOLE MILK - 8 0z 6300495 | 24/8 0Z $1ci§2 /
4 |SKIM MILK - 1/2 gal 2543767 | 11qr | 1390/
Case
5 |SKIM MILK - 8 0z 7167497 | 24/5pT | 1109/
Case
6 |2% MILK - 8 0z 6300479 | 24580z | 1150/
Case
7 [1% MILK - 1/2 gal
8 1% MILK - 8 0z 6355871 | 18/80Z $1ng2’
- 0 -
o |CHOCOLATEMILK- 1% - | arrocr | 1gm0s | 519617
8 0z Case
$10.30/
10|LACTATE FAT FREE -80z| 6532857 | 2080Z | 1
11|LACTOSE MILK - 8 6532857 | 2080z | °10-30/
"e0z Case 28074 20/80z 11.85
SILK SOY MILK, VANILLA - $16.827
12/g oz 177347 1880Z | "o 25226 | 18/80z 1710
SILK SOY MILK, $16.85/
13| CHOCOLATE - 8 oz 177321 1880Z | oo 25220 | 18/80z 1710
14|HALF & HALF - 8 0z
15|HALF & HALF - gt 4828554 | 12/32 0Z $ZC53§§ /
16|EGG NOG - Seasonal - gt 3279835 | 12/320Z $§;’§2 /
MINIMUM ORDER 20 CASES
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